Confidentiality Requested:

[ JYes [ No

KANSAS CORPORATION COMMISSION
OIL & GAS CONSERVATION DIvISION

WELL COMPLETION FORM

1237978

Form ACO-1

August 2013

Form must be Typed
Form must be Signed
All blanks must be Filled

WELL HISTORY - DESCRIPTION OF WELL & LEASE

OPERATOR: License #__ 4967
Berenergy Corporation

API No. 15 - 15-009-25868-00-00

Name: Spot Description:
Address 1: 7114 W. Jefferson Ave. SW_SE_NWNE gg. 24 Twp. 20 g g 11 [ ] East[ 0 West
Address 2: _Suite 206 1270 Feetfrom 0] North/ [] South Line of Section
City: Lakewood State: _CO__ zpp: 80235 , 1788 Feetfrom [0] East / [ ] West Line of Section
Contact Person: _David Braden Footages Calculated from Nearest Outside Section Corner:
Phone: (303 ) 969-9610 ONne [INnw [Ise [sw
CONTRAGTOR: License # 5822 GPS Location: Lat: , Long:
Name: val Energy, Inc. (e.9. XX.XXXXX) (e.9. -XXX.XXXXX)
Datum: | |NAD27 | |NAD83 | |wGss4
Wellsite Geologist: _Ryan Thress
. . County: Barton
Purchaser: _ Enterprise Crude Oil, LLC "
Lease Name: Roetzel ‘A Well #: 27
Designate Type of Completion:
Field Name:
[O] New Well [ ] Re-Entry [ ] Workover _ _
Producing Formation: Lansing-Kansas City
Qil WSW SWD SIOW
o [ [ [ Elevation: Ground:1749 Kelly Bushing: 1759
[ ] Gas [ ] D&A [ ] ENHR [ ] sicw
1 0G ] Gsw ] Temp. Abd Total Vertical Depth: 3365 Plug Back Total Depth:3230
] CM (Coal Bed Methane) Amount of Surface Pipe Set and Cemented at: 1334 Feet
[ ] cathodic [ ] Other (Core, Expl., etc.): Multiple Stage Cementing Collar Used? [ | Yes {7 |No
If Workover/Re-entry: Old Well Info as follows: If yes, show depth set: Feet

Operator:

Well Name:

Original Comp. Date: Original Total Depth:

[ ] Deepening [ |Re-perf. [ ] Conv.to ENHR [ | Conv.to SWD

[ ] Plug Back [ ] Conv.to GSW [ ] Conv.to Producer
[ ] Commingled Permit #:

[ ] Dual Completion Permit #:

[ ] SWD Permit #:

[ ] ENHR Permit #:

[ ] Gsw Permit #:

06/05/2014 06/13/2014 07/24/2014

Spud Date or Date Reached TD

Recompletion Date

Completion Date or
Recompletion Date

AFFIDAVIT

| am the affiant and | hereby certify that all requirements of the statutes, rules and
regulations promulgated to regulate the oil and gas industry have been fully complied
with and the statements herein are complete and correct to the best of my knowledge. Date:

Submitted Electronically

If Alternate Il completion, cement circulated from:

feet depth to: w/ sx cmt.

Drilling Fluid Management Plan
(Data must be collected from the Reserve Pit)

Chloride content: 3200 ppm  Fluid volume: 1000 bbls

Dewatering method used: Evaporated

Location of fluid disposal if hauled offsite:

Operator Name:

Lease Name: License #:
Quarter Sec. Twp. S. R. [ ]East[ |West
County: Permit #:

KCC Office Use ONLY

[ ] confidentiality Requested

[ ] Confidential Release Date:
Wireline Log Received

@ Geologist Report Received

[ uic Distribution

ALt 001 [ Jn [ Jm Approved by:

NAOMI JAMES

S Date: 01/12/2015




A 00T

1237978

Berenergy Corporation Roetzel ‘A well #: 27

Operator Name: Lease Name:

Sec. 24 Twp.20 S. rll [ ]East F ]West County: Barton

INSTRUCTIONS: Show important tops of formations penetrated. Detail all cores. Report all final copies of drill stems tests giving interval tested, time tool
open and closed, flowing and shut-in pressures, whether shut-in pressure reached static level, hydrostatic pressures, bottom hole temperature, fluid recovery,
and flow rates if gas to surface test, along with final chart(s). Attach extra sheet if more space is needed.

Final Radioactivity Log, Final Logs run to obtain Geophysical Data and Final Electric Logs must be emailed to kcc-well-logs @kcc.ks.gov. Digital electronic log
files must be submitted in LAS version 2.0 or newer AND an image file (TIFF or PDF).

Drill Stem Tests Taken [O]Yes [ |No 0] Log Formation (Top), Depth and Datum [ ] Sample
(Attach Additional Sheets)
Name TOR Datum
Samples Sent to Geological Survey Elves [ INo Attached Attached Attached
Cores Taken Llves [FINo
Electric Log Run [O]Yes [ INo
List All E. Logs Run:
Attached
CASING RECORD [0 New [ ]Used
Report all strings set-conductor, surface, intermediate, production, etc.
: Size Hole Size Casing Weight Setting Type of # Sacks Type and Percent
Purpose of String Drilled Set (In 0.D,) Lbs./Ft. Depth Cement Used Additives
Surface 12.25 8.625 24 1334 lead - 60/40 Pozmix, Tail - Clas | §5(0 lead - 8% gel, 3% CaCl2, 1/4 pps floseal
Production 7.875 5.5 15.5 3364 ASC 210 29 gel, 10% sall, 6% gypseal, 5# Kolses
ADDITIONAL CEMENTING / SQUEEZE RECORD
Purpose: Depth Type of Cement # Sacks Used Type and Percent Additives
Top Bottom
Perforate
Protect Casing R
Plug Back TD
Plug Off Zone
Did you perform a hydraulic fracturing treatment on this well? D Yes @ No (If No, skip questions 2 and 3)
Does the volume of the total base fluid of the hydraulic fracturing treatment exceed 350,000 gallons? D Yes D No (If No, skip question 3)
Was the hydraulic fracturing treatment information submitted to the chemical disclosure registry? D Yes D No (If No, fill out Page Three of the ACO-1)
Shots Per Foot PERFORATION RECORD - Bridge Plugs Set/Type Acid, Fracture, Shot, Cement Squeeze Record
Specify Footage of Each Interval Perforated (Amount and Kind of Material Used) Depth
Attached Attached Attached Attached
TUBING RECORD: Size: Set At: Packer At: Liner Run:
2.875 3108 [IYes  [Z]No
Date of First, Resumed Production, SWD or ENHR. Producing Method:
08/12/2014 [ ] Flowing [O] Pumping [ ] Gas Lift [ ] other (Explain)
Estimated Production Qil Bbls. Gas Mcf Water Bbls. Gas-Oil Ratio Gravity
Per 24 Hours 1 0 0 42
DISPOSITION OF GAS: METHOD OF COMPLETION: PRODUCTION INTERVAL:
[O]Vented [ |Sold [ ]Used on Lease [ ] Open Hole (7] Perf. [ ] Dually Comp. [ ] Commingled 3034-3094
(Submit ACO-5) (Submit ACO-4)
(If vented, Submit ACO-18.) D Other (Specify)

Mail to: KCC - Conservation Division, 130 S. Market - Room 2078, Wichita, Kansas 67202



Form ACOL1 - Well Completion
Operator Berenergy Corporation
Well Name Roetzel ‘A’ 27

Doc ID 1237978

All Electric Logs Run

Borehole Compensated Sonic Log

Microresistivity Log
Dual Compensated Porosity Log

Dual Induction Log
Computer Processed Interpretation

Sonic Cement Bond Log




Form ACOL1 - Well Completion

Operator Berenergy Corporation

Well Name Roetzel ‘A’ 27

Doc ID 1237978

Tops
N N =
Chase Group 1398 361
Tarkio Lime 2261 -502
Topeka Lime 2577 -818
Heebner Shale 2844 -1085
Toronto Lime 2850 -1091
Brown Lime 2970 -1211
Lansing-Kansas City 2987 -1228
Arbuckle 3247 -1475




Form ACOL1 - Well Completion
Operator Berenergy Corporation
Well Name Roetzel ‘A’ 27
Doc ID 1237978
Perforations
T e e
4 3299-3303
4 3279-3282
CIBP 3270
4 3248-3252 acidize - 250 gal. 15%
MOD 202 acid
CIBP 3230
4 3090-3094, 3034- acidize - 750 gal. 15%
3038 NE, 2000 gal. 15% NE
w/ 40 balls




RILOBITE'
ESTING Inc.

Test Ticket

Oy~
1515 Commerce Parkway - Hays, Kansas 67601 e 58 7

Well Name & No. ED erzel A 27 TestNo. ! Date O(//O// i

" Company_Eeren £n Croy (r)r’pnrm,'on Elevation 175 & ke_/ 7 47 GL

Address PO Box 5850 D?#"I/P/}. co w0217

Co.Rep/Geo._Ep/ Buc henan Rg_ Vel &

“Lecation: Sec. 24 Twp. _ 205 Rge. 1w Co. Barton State KJ
Interval Tested_50 3 2 =t 307? ZoneTested _ L an f/n; Kansas (/‘T v “D £F &
Anchor Length Az Drill Pipe Run 3023 Mud Wt. 90
Top Packer Depth 5 o2 7 Drill Collars Run o Vis 4 9’
Bottom Packer Depth 3032 Wt. Pipe Run o we_ 9.9
Total Depth > o797 Chlorides /5 OO ppm System LCM

Blow Description TE: Stron: Ripws , BOB in 2 winuresS
LST: yo Rlows Ralk
FF: S1rpp, Blow, BOBimmedicre
FSI-'/V0/Q/0\;J Back
Rec 2/7C  Feetot_ T P %gas %oil Y%water %mud
Rec 110 Feetot_GOC M /5 %gas /5 %ol Y%water 722 %mud
Rec Feet of %gas %eoil Ywater Y%mud
Rec Feet of %gas %0il Y%water %mud
Rec Feet of %gas %0il Yewater %mud
Rec Total | /0 BHT _ 102 Graity _29.C  aPIRW #//c @ /r//? °F Chlorides <% ¢ ppm
(A) Initial Hydrostatic /1495 @ Test i/ / 506 T-On Location _ 4. 3O
(B) First Initial Flow 31 " Jars 2156 T-Started as o7
(C) First Final Flow 40 @ Safety Joint 7] T-Open ©7.50
(D) Initial Shut-In 75% Q Circ Sub T-Pulled /7 - f/i
(E) Second Initial Flow L2 EI/HourIy Standby [ /00 ot /L
(F) Second Final Flow 63 @ Mileage ﬁ }B‘ /1 %{ Lomnelts
(G) Final Shut-In 72 7 @ Sampler P i 50
(H) Final Hydrostatic /4 79 Q Straddle Q Ruined Shale Packer

. O Shale Packer Q Ruined Packer
Initial Open ) O Extra Packer & s
Initial Shut-In €o O Extra Recorder Sub Total
Final Flow 1% 0O Day Standby Total
Final Shut-In 120 O Accessibility MP/DST Disc't
SubTotal___ 20// .

Approved By ?,/ /M é{%“’ 6/ b/“’“ Our Representative b %

Trilobite Testing Inc. shall not be liable for damaged of any kind of the property or personnel of the one for whom a test is made, or fo?‘any'lossm or sustained, directly or indirectly, through the use of its
equipment, or its statements or opinion concerning the results of any test, tools lost or damaged in the hole shall be paid for at cost by the party for whom the test is made.
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{ TRILOBITE TESTING, INC.

. P.O. Box 362 ¢ Hays, Kansas 67601

B
=
=
s
3

W

[ Calug(l!

N

FLUID SAMPLER DATA

Ticket No. 5% Ll pate &L /10 /14

Company Name _[5 €7 €7 Ene Yoy Cod/po/on]sion

Lease [R0CT=zel A27 TestNo. _|

County _Beorren Sec. _ 2! Twp. 2 oS Rng. _// L/

SAMPLER RECOVERY PIT MUD ANALYSIS

Gas 29,04 CuFT & ML Chiorides 1600 ppm.

oil Y ooe ML Resistivity_ & /¢ ohms @ F

Mud ML Viscosity kB8 L Y

Water ML  Mud Weight _4. ©

Other ML Filtrate _ ¢ .7

Pressure {oo f:f—-[ ML Other

Total fHooo  w

SAMPLER ANALYSIS PIPE RECOVERY

Resistivity ohms @ F TOP )
Resistivity N/C ohms @ F

Chilorides ppm. 7.
Chiorides < ppm.
MIDDLE

Gravity 3.6 corrected @60F  Resistivity ohms @ F
Chlorides ppm.
BOTTOM
Resistivity ohms @ B
Chlorides A ppm.




DRILL STEM TEST REPORT

RILOBITE
ESTING , INC.

PO Box 5850
Denver, CO 80217

SN

_‘a"':n‘l'u"m(-""‘
= I

ATTN: Ed Buchanan

Beren Energy Corporation

24-20S-11W Barton

Roetzel A 27

Job Ticket: 58994

DST#:1

Test Start: 2014.06.10 @ 05:07:47

GENERAL INFORMATION:

Formation: Lansing Kansas City
Deviated: No Whipstock: ft (KB) Test Type: Conventional Bottom Hole (initial)
Time Tool Opened: 07:50:17 Tester: Leal Cason
Time Test Ended: 14:44:32 Unit No: 74
Interval: 3032.00 ft (KB) To  3079.00 ft (KB) (TVD) Reference Bevations: 1759.00 ft (KB)
Total Depth: 3079.00 ft (KB) (TVD) 1749.00 ft (CF)
Hole Diameter: 7.88 inchesHole Condition: Good KB to GRI/CF: 10.00 ft
Serial #: 8367 Outside
Press@RunDepth: 63.27 psig @ 3033.00 ft (KB) Capacity: 8000.00 psig
Start Date: 2014.06.10 End Date: 2014.06.10 Last Calib.: 2014.06.10
Start Time: 05:07:47 End Time: 14:44:32 Time On Bt 2014.06.10 @ 07:49:47
Time Off Btrr
TEST COMMENT: IF: Strong Blow, BOB in 2 minutes
ISk No Blow Back
FF: Strong Blow, BOB immediate
FSi: No Blow Back
= Pressare vs. Time - PRESSURE SUMMARY
ol ] | T 1 Time | Pressure| Temp | Annotation
; S 1. | Mn) (psig) | (degP)
t } lL } ] 0| 1495.55 99.45 | Initial Hydro-static
=1 | " | ?- = 1 30.98 99.27 | Open To Flow (1)
_ | [ E ;‘\ 1. 16| 39.87 | 100.15] Shut-in(1)
- r b st P 77 | 757.99 | 101.19| End Shut-in(1)
o ] i Lo H 1.3 78| 4255 | 100.72| Open To Flow(2)
=i i s —H .5 137 | 6327 | 101.07|Shut-n(2)
ol I | | I 173 257 | 72858 | 102.16| End Shut-in(2)
- } : : [ 2 259 | 1478.15 | 101.86| End Shut-n(3)
| ;’ | / . § .
= K | | | : ind
l\ | | | 1.
[ ' ]
Ly : - : ! s =
WResnIW = el Ty iy =
Recowery Gas Rates
Length () Description Volume (bbi) I Chole (inches) | Pressure (psig) ]GasRae(Mcfld)J
0.00 2170 GP 0.00
110.00 GOCM 15%G 15%0 70%M 1.54
Trilobite Testing, Inc Ref. No: 58994 Printed: 2014.06.10 @ 14:58:36
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RILOBITE - Test Ticket

ESTING inc. No. DB%95
1515 Commerce Parkway - Hays, Kansas 67601

WellName & No. Rpltze) A 27 ' TestNo. ___ 2 Date 0«4/////Lf

Company_Berorn ergy ColPora T 0N Elevaton_ /757 x /747 GL

Address Po LsX 5850 Denver, lo 3027

Co.Rep/Geo. £l Buctanan Rg_ Vol &

Location: Sec. 24 Twp. 205 Rge. )/ v co. Borron State A S
Interval Tested 324 q, g = 3256.5 Zone Tested Ay bhack!e
Anchor Length 7 Drill Pipe Run 32406 Mudwt 7.3
Top Packer Depth 52 HA. 5’ Drill Collars Run s Vis 5 2
Bottom Packer Depth 32 Ifff 5 Wt. Pipe Run o we_ ¥-€
Total Depth 325¢.5 Chlorides Fezz>  ppmSystem  LCM
Blow Description -/ /. 7 [0 Rlow, RuB in 90 Jeconds
LST Mo Bl Reck
FE: Weak glov Buwl do £inchesby Sminares Deed @ 25 miaries
Fsz: NOo0 Blow PBack
Rec 6 Feetof S OME L %gas [ %oil f o%water 24/ %mud
Rec ¥ 00 Feetof M ¢ %Qas %oil S0 Ywater 22 %mud
Rec Feet of %gas %0il Y%water %mud
Rec Feet of %gas %0il Y%water %mud
Rec ‘ Feet of %gas %o0il Yowater %mud
Rec Total g06 BHT __jo &  Gravity __ /<  APIRW_. /6 @ £ O °F Chlorides _ /700G ppm
(A) Initial Hydrostatic 163/ @& Test VARG T-On Location /5 ' 45
(B) First Init?ésl Flow 106 @ Jars 246 T-Started Jeie) !
(C) First Final Flow 30/ & Safety Joint >4 Topen__ /¥ /7
(D) Initial Shut-In 368 Q Circ Sub =RHled 72,:33
(E) Second Initial Flow Jo4 @ Hourly Standby 2 geo ot of ”? ,6 = N
S — T N T R
(G) Final Shut-In 362 O sampler 250 i '
(o) AR R AT 157 g U Straddie U Ruined Shale Packer

Q' Shale Packer QO Ruined Packer

Initial Open 15 Q Extra Packer O Extra Copies
Initial Shut-In é@ 0| S s Sub Total
Final Flow é % 0 Day Standby Total
Final Shut-In (20 Q Accessibility MP/DST Disc't

SubTotal__ 271}

Approved By 5/%{& é&u 6// 2/20"‘/ Our Representa%w““/‘“ﬁ/

Trilobite Testing Inc. shall not be liable for damaged of any kind of the property or personnel of the one for whom a test is made, or for any loss suffered or sustained, directly or indirectly, through the use of its
equipment, or its statements or opinion concerning the results of any test, tools lost or damaged in the hole shall be paid for at cost by the party for whom the test is made.




};% TRILOBITE TESTING, INC.

. P.O. Box 362 * Hays, Kansas 67601

FLUID SAMPLER DATA

Ticket No. 5?7‘7f Date /‘é//;//q

Company Name B Cre€hn 6/51/1/ (C?/;?OKW' 107

Lease ﬁCl”tZ?l A=-27 TestNo. _ 2
County _[Pas 7 0N Sec. 24 Twp. _ 205  Rng. /4
SAMPLER RECOVERY PIT MUD ANALYSIS
Gas R Heu -7 M Chlorides Loco ppm.
oil ML Resistivity A7/ < ohms @__ /' F
Mud ML Viscosity 2 2
Water 2 000 ML  Mud Weight 9.3
Other ML  Filtrate ? 8
Pressure 29 751 ML Other
Total 2000 ML
SAMPLER ANALYSIS PIPE RECOVERY
Resistivity 7 omse €] F TOP b
Resistivity - /6 ohms @ Lo F
Chiorides | 7000 ppm.
Chlorides { 7000 ppm.
/i MIDDLE
Gravity /l/ c corrected @60F  Resistivity Lk ohms @ 60 B
Chlorides | 706 ppm.
BOTTOM
Resistivity - 16 ohms@ _ 6O F

-~ Chlorides | 7060 ppm.



Serial #: 6798 Inside Berenergy Corporation Roetzel A 27 DST Test Number: 2
Pressure vs. Time
Lv]
6798 Pressure 6798 Temperature
1750 : ] 110
. 4+ 105
1500 .
N +— 100
1250 =
~ +— 95
n 7 o
I~ N )
B 1 o 3
D 1000 =— 90 o
g | : g
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o - RS u In\_._
i [ -+— 80
500 -
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O 1 i N
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11 Wed Jun 2014 Time (Hours)

Trilobite Testing, Inc

Ref. No: 58995

Printed: 2014.06.12 @ 08:39:21




DRILL STEM TEST REPORT

RILOBITE

"5 3 Berenergy Corporation

2o ESTING , INC] o o 5650

2 E = Denver, CO 80217
e

ATIN: E Buchanan

24-20S-11W Barton

Roetzel A 27
Job Ticket: 58995 DST#:2

Test Start: 2014.06.11 @ 16:41:24

GENERAL INFORMATION:

Formation; Arbuckle
Deviated: No Whipstock: ft (KB) Test Type: Conventional Bottom Hole (Reset)
Time Tool Opened: 18:17:09 Tester: Leal Cason
Time Test Ended: 08:26:24 Unit No: 74
interval: 3250.00 ft (KB) To  3257.00 ft (KB) (TVD) Reference Hevations: 1759.00 ft (KB)
Total Depth: 3256.50 ft (KB) (TVD) 1749.00 ft (CF)
Hole Diameter: 7.88 inchesHole Condition: Good KB to GR/CF: 10.00 ft
Serial #: 6798 Inside
Press@RunDepth: 367.59 psig @ 3250.50 ft (KB) Capacity: 8000.00 psig
Start Date: 2014.06.11 End Date: 2014.06.12 Last Calib.: 2014.06.12
Start Time: 16:41:24 End Time: 08:26:24  Time On Btm: 2014.06.11 @ 18:08:09

Time Off Btm:  2014.06.11 @ 22:36:09

TEST COMMENT: IF: Strong Blow, BOB in 90 seconds
ISt No Blow Back

FF: Weak Blow , Built to 6 inches by 8 minutes, Dead @ 25 minutes

FStk No Blow Back

e Pressure v, Time - PRESSURE SUMMARY
™= Foe— = ™ Time Pressure| Temp | Annotation
ol A : (Min.) (psig) | (degF)
- Lt | — 0| 1630.67 | 106.02| initial Hydro-static
: } : § B 9| 10584 | 106.98| Open To Flow (1)
= 1 q. 25| 301.05 | 108.12{ Shut-in(1)
4 f ; Pl i 85| 367.61 | 108.10] End Shut-in(1)
i= : : { 1=3 86| 30361 | 108.07| Open To Flow(2)
: ‘ f B § 146 | 367.59 | 108.07| Shut-n(2)
im ==t 1 266 | 368.18 | 108.05| End Shut-in(2)
E / L X ' 268 | 1587.85 | 107.88 Final Hydro-static
=t / | ‘J{ i
=t T f i
i | [ 1 .
L | . i
L} - 7Bu kL as E ]
11 Sad AnZRM T o)
Recowery Gas Rates
Length (f) Description Volume (bbi) | Chote (inches) lPressu'e(psIg) Gas Rete (Mctd)
800.00 MCW 20%M 80%W 11.22
6.00 SOMCW 1%0 24%M 75%W 0.08
“Recovery from mitiple tests
Trilobite Testing, Inc Ref. No: 58995 Printed: 2014.06.12 @ 08:39:21




ALLIED C IL & GAS SERVI_ES, LLC 052974

Federal Tax I.D. # 20-8651475

REMIT TO P.O.B0OX 93999 SERVICE POINT:
SOUTHLAKE, TEXAS 76092 P Baed Yo
1 [SEC TP RANGE CALLED OUT ON LOCATION  [JOB START  [JOB FINISH
D‘.‘TE{" e [ SO 7 L U 2.0 P 230 bm (I Cz)llt!‘{ J 2’07 AM
Roctes) should  be #27 ‘ COUNTY STATE
LEASE WELL# e LOCATION.? K] 5 & po DG [ S £ oo X | el D toFor
e 1]
OLD OR NEW(Circle one) Gy el

CONTRACTOR “}.5 ¥ |,

OWNER Se...s

TYPEOFJOB < ,. % LSS

To: Allied Oil & Gas Services, LLC.

You are hereby requested to rent cementing equipment
and furnish cementer and helper(s) to assist owner or
contractor to do work as is listed. The above work was
done to satisfaction and supervision of owner agent or
contractor. I have read and understand the "GENERAL

| TERMS AND CONDITIONS" listed on the reverse side.

\

PRINTED NAME <+ 0o Burcswin

-
dr Tien Riven s

HOLESIZE | 7| T.D. LAY CEMENT
CASING SIZE = =/ ¢ DEPTH /334"’ AMOUNT ORDERED 4 50,9, L. 4o 876 M4}, d%eCC |
TUBING SIZE DEPTH %" Aomali ~ Fo0dy Qars A, 3%0cc
DRILL PIPE DEPTH
TOOL DEPTH
PRES. MAX | 9.0 MINIMUM 70 & COMMON__2evey @_17.90 _S370.00
MEAS. LINE SHOE JOINT4{ &1 POZMIX @
CEMENT LEFT IN CSG.4{ & *I% GEL , @
PERFS. CHLORIDE _ 2o ¥ @_l.ip 282 .00
DISPLACEMENT 97,37 ASC @
EQUIPMENT Alw 2350 @ _|%%1  _biSF.eo
LA (oﬂ_)\\w\ i r\ Florssl) ®1.8 g £.97 #S%,. 87
PUMPTRUCK CEMENTER 7 o \usodb o = p
# 00 HELPER TWeobe T8RN @
BULK TRUCK ! @
#5959 DRIVER e Tchaan @
BULK TRUCK \ i @
#Ho9- 239  DRIVER Dyouy.d MoATuman (VD) HANDLING 243,12 @ 2.9 176%.59
MILEAGE __30.8%2Xxa0r 2.25 _j204.5L
REMARKS: TOTAL 12, 842.9%7
il& ~ 'l""s..?**‘ R "Pﬁ"’ff‘?m»-l L Pt Camen 8 aYon
T VeI S amml:%m SERVICE
‘3%1\3&, A%CL., !"“ﬁ hﬁh‘ .Lankafﬁlag \yf; B D
B 300 rbo Caann &, Adaec: NaNaeand DEPTH OF JOB | 32¢|
R "l‘hMi Nesesd w3 akd. H2O. | e i PUMP TRUCK CHARGE Jafa e
L y hm W duead 3+ KF80eX  WeXN. EXTRA FOOTAGE @ ' 5
Carveard Dud Comtp dpXog MILEAGE 20 @ 1,20 154, o0
|49 hBlC CormaT T Duk MANIFOLD @ |
Lym a0 @ Y4 & 00
Ha e RoX @ 22560 _27S.600
CHARGE TO: [N\etew = ray Cocp.,
2 =
Mo TOTAL £230.25
(G STATE b PLUG & FLOAT EQUIPMENT
T s = %5/% AEv £8cex Sl
-.—:E" o] Afv Hq o Cellnn

@ _Sbs.o0 112.00

T LN

%

3. T,ﬂ“v‘ L.q_,\& L«Of.jﬁu

@ _S(,0.00 _ SLo.o0
@ _RS.00 1206.0% .

SALES TAX (If Any)

TOTAL S30:7.00

TOTAL CHARGES _ ¥ 2(,,0406.92

DISCOUNT _|_{

W
SIGNATURE v et Xk

e SI0, 1R

IF PAID IN 30 DAYS

8 19,530.LY

1


David_2010
Typewritten Text
should be #27


ALLIED ML & GAS SERVI'ES, LLC 063552

Federal Tax I.D. # 20-8651475

REMIT TO P.O.BOX 93999 SERVICE POINT:
SOUTHLAKE, TEXAS 76092 I Boen
SEC. TWP. RANGE CALLED OUT ON LOCATION |J STA OB FINISH
DATH - 13- A4 20 1 2.0 bM 1,.30%Mm .%(Dﬁ\ ls’;@bl‘ﬂ
= g should be #27 : COUNTY STATE
LEASEe nsd  |WELL# (g LOCATIONA% [+ San WIKy ISE 1 . Pl o
OLD Oﬁ;ﬁ%(Circle one) DS O
CONTRACTOR \)a X OWNER S ¢ e
TYPE OF JOB ?M\ DG daase
HOLESIZE ] /% TD. 33teS CEMENT
CASING SIZE 5" a. DEPTH AMOUNT ORDERED 2o hsc . 296 A,
TUBING SIZE DEPTH St L7 Anira . S* Ve lnal/nk . 3% 5)ic
DRILL PIPE DEPTH ~Y : Dl
TOOL DEPTH :
PRES. MAX | ©) (> MINIMUM 4/<x0) COMMON__.7 0O ef2,30  _ 853700
MEAS. LINE SHOE JOINT 44,79 POZMIX _ 2 6 @ 938 182,00
CEMENT LEFT IN CSG. 44 73 GEL 358 * @ 1.oS _ 372590
PERES. CHLORIDE @
DISPLACEMENT 79,5/ ASC Al0 eadld,So  _4/33S.00
EQUIPMENT Yolnid 10S0% e .38 _jodl.oo
E- 1.0 .Sn“ @ 19.% _ 94¢S.co
X @_3.30 hr e o)
PUMPTRUCK CEMENTER =T oo WtaMownr -
v 557 e e Flawsn) TfEEd* R
BULK TRUCK | __ @
#%00 -8UY DRIVER oo \aaoesn :
BULK TRUCK
8 DRIVER HANDLING _ 311, 94 @ 24% _73l.oS
MILEAGE _ 3e0. 3>  2.25 _835.9]
REMARKS: TOTAL _9232.00
i”.l.".v L e :;i\— i - J .
DS o, Eo  DUN0O, P issasd SERVICE
\3\»3.9“ ,k.hs w/ ’tt‘) :\Lﬂ. MCMM&-J&'N N/ 20) AR-A\A 4 s
Marad 210 s ASC. 2%, AR 10%0S0rX, DEPTH OF JOB A558.75
L% A‘“‘?"‘"“& & ¥ YeSandfale, 2 3% T)- 1o, PUMP TRUCK CHARGE
9% f Jecomntn, . Lo mJ e EXTRA FOOTAGE @
B Hia' 7 MILEAGE __ J.c, @ella _|sH.00
s D) . MANIFOED LM do @llg Ri.00
“,__.‘—-{X}\ lh-ﬁxg\ Cor oo it Aporae
ﬁv\ I*MA Voo A @m ;‘SZZ,SQ
CHARGE TO: EQAMLA_%( %
A W\ TOTAL 332%.2S
CITY STATE ZIP
PLUG & FLOAT EQUIPMENT
55 £Uok $Quoe (9800 [OBD
‘35: (‘J‘JWM @ ,S Z.OO
To: Allied Oil & Gas Services, LLC. *\»U-f\ Fhone @ %300 _ 3500
You are hereby requested to rent cementing equipment ; - g‘{’; i;‘x . : g 2900 q?
and furnish cementer and helper(s) to assist owner or = 3 ‘J""";‘\ = €0
contractor to do work as is listed. The above work was =
done to satisfaction and supervision of owner agent or TOTAL am’ 0
contractor. I have read and understand the "GENERAL
TERMS AND CONDITIONS" listed on the reverse side. ~ SALES TAX (If Any)

PRINTED NAME \/ L. E. Bvcwmman/
Y

SIGNATURE\{
\

o 1 Bpaud) B LH3/ 2004

TOTAL CHARGES ') le, 107, 2S
piscount |4/ 241, gl IF PAID IN 30 DAYS

122284y
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T. M. MCCOY & CO., INC.

Well Name:
Location:

License Number:
Spud Date:

Surface Coordinates:

Bottom Hole Coordinates:

Ground Elevation (ft):
Logged Interval (ft):
Formation:

Type of Drilling Fluid:

Company:
Address:

Name:
Company:
Address:

CONSULTING GEOLOGISTS
P.O. BOX 608 - WILSON, WYOMING 83014 -307-733-4332

Scale 1:240 (5"=100") Imperial
Measured Depth Log

Berenergy Corporation H.J. Roetzel 'A' 27

SW SE NW NE Sec. 24, T20S, R11W, Barton County, Kansas

15-009-25868 Region:

June 4, 2014 Drilling Completed: June 12, 2014
1270' FNL & 1788' FEL

Lat/Long: 38.3007925, -98.4855037

Vertical Hole

1749 K.B. Elevation (ft); 1759'
1334 To: TD Total Depth (ft): 3365
Chase Group through Arbuckle
Fresh water and water based mud
Printed by MUD.LOG from WellSight Systems 1-800-447-1534 www.WellSight.co

OPERATOR

Berenergy Corporation
1888 Sherman St #600
Denver, Colorado
80203

GEOLOGIST

Ryan Thress

T. M. McCoy & Co., Inc.
P.O. Box 608

Wilson, WY 83014
307-733-4332
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SHALE: light olive gray to greenish gray, soft,
occasional millimeter-sized platy cuttings, some
zones very calcareous, others non calcareous,
without significant difference in appearance. Rar
pyrite nodules.

LIMESTONE: white (N9), sub-millimeter sized
chips, rounded, strong reaction in HCI.

SANDSTONE: clear to white (N9), soft to firm,
subrounded medium to corase-grained sand
sized chips composed of very fine to fine-grained
sand, typically a lime sandstone, commonly
micaceous, calcite cemented.

trace CHERT: white to clear, hard, conchoidal
fracture, no reaction with HCI.

LIMESTONE: white (N9), sub-millimeter sized
chips, rounded, strong reaction in HCI.
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SHALE! light olive gray to greenish gray, sofl
occasional millimeter-sized platy cuttings, some
zones very calcareous, others non calcareous,
without significant difference in appearance. Rar
pyrite nodules.

SANDSTONE: clear to white (N9), soft to firm,
subrounded medium to corase-grained sand
sized chips composed of very fine to fine-grained
sand, typically a lime sandstone, commonly
micaceous, calcite cemented.

trace CHERT: white to clear, hard, conchoidal
fracture, no reaction with HCI.

SHALE: light olive gray to greenish gray, soft,
occasional millimeter-sized platy cuttings, some
zones very calcareous, others non calcareous,
without significant difference in appearance. Rar
pyrite nodules.

LIMESTONE: white (N9), sub-millimeter sized
chips, rounded, strong reaction in HCI.

SANDSTONE: clear to white (N9), soft to firm,
subrounded medium to corase-grained sand
sized chips composed of very fine to fine-grained
sand, typically a lime sandstone, commonly
micaceous, calcite cemented.

SHALE: med light gray (N6) to dark greenish gra
(5GY 4/1) to dark reddish brown (10R 3/4), mod
firm, platy, generally smooth, locally gritty/silty,
locally calcareous.
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30-ft samples 2200'-2350'

SHALE: dark greenish gray (5GY 4/1), soft, platy
to sub blocky, moderate reaction to HCI.

2230" no fluorescence, occasional chip has slow
streaming pale yellow cut, weak splotchy halo.

SHALE: dark reddish brown (10R 3/4) to very
dusky red (10R 2/2), platy, soft, moderately stron
reaction to HCI, fully decrepitates in HCI.

SHALE: med dark gray (N4) to a dark greenish
gray (5G 4/1), platy to sub blocky, long thin
blades common, soft to mod firm, locally
micaceous, calcareous.

2260": no fluorescence, occasional chip has slow
streaming pale yellow cut, no halo.

LIMESTONE: very light gray (N8) to light gray
(N7), platy to sub blocky, firm to moderately harc
brittle, very reactive to HCI.

SHALE: medium gray (N5) to meduim dark gray
(N4), very soft, platy to sub rounded, no to slight
reaction in HCI

2290": yellow fluorescence, slow diffuse pale
yellow cut, splotchy halo.

CHERT: white to clear, hard, commonly large,
well-rounded grains, conchoidal fracture, no
reaction with HCI.

LIMESTONE: white (N9), platy to sub-blocky, soft|
to firm, reacts very strongly to HCI, locally
fossiliferous.

2320": yellow fluorescence, slow diffuse pale
yellow cut, splotchy yellow halo.

SHALE: dark greenish gray (5GY 4/1), soft, platy,
moderate reaction to HCI, light patchy oil
staining.

2350": yellow fluorescence, slow diffuse pale
yellow cut, splotchy halo.




No samples caught 2350'-2570'
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10-ft samples 2570 to TD

SHALE: light gray (N6) to med. dark gray (N4) to
grayish black (N2), platy to sub blocky, very soft
to moderately firm, waxy, locally micaceous, no
reaction to a moderate reaction in HCI, occasion
patches of pyrite flakes and rare nodules.

SILTSTONE: medium gray (N5) to meduim dark
gray (N4), sub blocky, soft, grity with local areas
of high clay content and locally micaceous, sligt
to no reaction in HCI.

2570" very slow diffuse cut, splotchy, incompletd
very pale yellow residual halo.

SHALE: dark reddish brown (10R 3/4) to very
dusky red (10R 2/2), platy, soft, locally grity
appearance, moderately strong reaction to HCI,
fully decrepitates in HCI.

SHALE: dark greenish gray (5GY 4/1), soft, platy
to sub blocky, moderate reaction to HCI.

2610" no fluorescence, no cut, no halo.

LIMESTONE: mottled white (N9) to light gray (N7
to buff, crystalline and algal limestone common,

blocky, firm to very hard, locally fossiliferous, ng
visible porosity, vigorous reaction to HCI, firm to
hard, smells strongly of sulfur while reacting wit

HCI.

2640" dull yellow fluorescence, no cut, no halo.

LIMESTONE: light gray (N7) to bluish white (5B
9/1) mottled with medium dark gray (N4), firm to
very hard, blocky to sub-blocky, crystalline,
fossiliferous, vigorous reaction to HCI.

2670" pale yellow fluorescence, slow diffuse palg
yellow cut, no halo.

SHALE: medium dark gray (N4) to black (N1), firr
platy cuttings, slightly calcareous, no
fluorescence.
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LIMESTONE: pale yellowish brown (10YR 6/2) to
very light gray (N8), firm, sub blocky cuttings,
mudstone to wackestone texture, unidentifiable
fossil debris, no visible porosity, argillaceous,
very dull yellow fluorescence, yellow diffuse
cloudy cut.

2720" dull yellow fluorescence,no cut, spatchy
incomplete halo.

SHALE: medium gray (N5) to medium dark gray
(N4), firm, platy cuttings, slightly calcareous, no
fluorescence.

LIMESTONE: yellowish gray (5Y 8/1), hard, sub
blocky, wackestone, local calcite lined vug
porosity, rare fracture porosity with residual
stain, vigorous reaction in HCI with strong odor
sulfurous odor.

2760": very slow diffuse cut, splotchy, incompletd
very pale yellow residual halo.

LIMESTONE: med light gray (N6), occurs as
blocky cuttings, mudstone, locally streaked with
medium dark gray (N4) argillaceous material, no
fluorescence.

SHALE: med dark gray (N4) to dark gray (N3),
platy and elongated, firm and brittle, locally very
silty, strong reaction to HCI; also occasionally a
very dusky red (10R 2/2), higher silt content, soft
slightly calcareous.

2800": pale yellow with splotches of yellow
mineral fluorescence, pale yellow diffuse cut.

LIMESTONE: yellowish gray (5Y 8/1), firm to
moderately hard, blocky cuttings, mudstone to
wackestone, commonly fossiliferous, occasional
fracture porosity with residual stain, occasional
chert fragments, pale dull yellow fluorescence.

SHALE: med dark gray (N4) to dark gray (N3),
platy and elongated, firm and brittle, waxy, local
moderately strong reaction to HCI.

2840" pale yellow mineral fluorescence, pale
yellow diffuse cut, incomplete patchy halo.

SHALE: grayish black (N2) to black (N1), platy,
firm and brittle, waxy yet with a slightly gritty
appearance, weak reaction to HCI.




M i =—== 3’"\)\/"\ 1] I ] 1359 ppm CZ TT] i |
— ppm - Missed Sample
14 === | i d 1040 ppm C3 | [] 2870' MD: Missed Sampl
d —— ! \ . 606 ppm C4
+ (N I/ I ====== 1l & \ LIMESTONE: very pale orange (LOYR 8/2), occurs|
T E———— T N = as ~Imm subangular chips, firm to hard, locally
-PASON EDR < ‘\ = ™ fossiliferous, reacts vigorously to HCI.
| Shutdown | —— —
i === DY P
WT 8.9 - == = ”ﬁstag EDR
2882 i Vs 43 R S ———T— ——T — = '/? =hutdowm 2880": dull yellow mineral fluorescence, slow ligh
Douglas ——— = reen diffuse cut.
GrOL?p ™~ N 1 == ]{ \ ’
I I
N (111 = ——]
/ ANAY 1 SHALE: moderate brown (5YR 3/4), moderately
\ \ [‘ R o soft, platy to sub blocky cuttings, gritty, silty,
\ 7 117 1 calcareous, no fluorescence.
+ N LS o [ = i
[ J S [[]]] { AR
\ ° — 7l 2903'
=== i 71 [ 103u T
t HH I ’I II | 5844 ppm C1 SHALE: dark greenish gray (5GY 4/1), soft, platy
S i i 1 T iggg ppm g: to sub blocky, moderate reaction to HCI.
ppm C3
{ | L —= 1549 ppm C4
f | %_'22 2920": pale yellow mineral fluorescence, no cut,
no halo.
\ / ) '\ = — ]] |
< 4 7 LIMESTONE: very pale orange (10YR 8/2), occurs|
] \ 1 as ~1mm subangular chips, firm to hard, locally
I NT \lés,‘ J fossiliferous, reacts vigorously to HCI.
7 § —— N {
[ S ——
WT 8.9 )Y || | —— 1 2934
VS 46 { / —— 116u TG 2940' MD: Missed Sample
[ [[— [ |3 £ N N 6349 ppm C1
[ 2 D
( > —— == 7 / 1947 ppm C2
‘ﬁ i — = Ly 1507 ppm Cj SHALE: light gray (N6) to med. dark gray (N4),
WOB 16 Y ~ = [[[TE= ) 1789 ppm C sub blocky, very soft, waxy, micaceous, locally
RPM 77 > B [TTEes — K& silty with gritty appearance, no reaction to a
PSI 1007 d g [MMMEe— = ) moderate reaction in HC, sample mainly consist
SPM 53 { \ —— ||| | /= — | of armored mudballs--unconsolidated clays balls|
> { m —— — H \l with rock chips.
+ \ \ = ]
P JT & % )
| ] =3 '\~\§
| { 2965 By
} ,) i \ : 1010 TG 2970": Missed Sample
2973 i~ 4 e ) | 6273 ppm CH— | IMESTONE: dark yellowish brown (10YR 4/2),
- ~— > — [ = ] \ 1501 ppm C2 blocky, angular, very hard, dense, crystalline,
Brown ( : — N — ) 1248 ppm C3 locally fossiliferous, reacts vigorously to HCI.
Lime A = [l =2 P p 7 1060 ppm C4
_'_I_ —_— <t
p - y 117} === - N hB ~ 2980 no minelral fluorescence, slow streaming
LS L4 —T—— . ) < K light blue cut, incomplete halo.
N ) —r— = L { ]
(11T == I SILTSTONE: medium gray (N5) to meduim dark
2990 N == [[TTEe—=——=" Q ( { gray (N4), sub blocky, soft, grity with local areas
Lansing- — < === ———— ‘ T of high clay content and locally micaceous, sligh
Kansas Wrod \ < — % - i L] D to no reaction in HCI.
8 | ] —— T e
i VS 48 d EANT—/—— :|:":|:_—
City ‘\ A 7 s AS  — —T— 1 [ N— { 3000": dull yellow to rare bright yellow mineral
= T — ey — e S L —;—:—'F‘- % ~ T n =gy T Tc ¢ fluorescence, slow streaming pale yellow cut,
*n 5ola0 Sy b0 1 [ [ =—— : b 1 hY J{o oblo.1 1 S 110 1000 1Qe4] incomplete halo.
0 A 1 = . e aghnt-m Cligpy) LIMESTONE: white (N9) to grayish orange (10YR
/ W= === === A \ o-—topiio 1ho 8 151 o4 —(3pe5——10edl 714), hard, sub blocky cuttings, fossiliferous,
—— % 5 Uﬁ?};n U subhedral pyrite, rare vugs, locally a packstone
B \ ST T ] :RJ;f:v': === (/ T 00010 tpo % 64301155 10ed| but more commonly dense mudstone, local oil
1 P D) ———F][[[—x mn= 7 cabpf) 1283 TG c staining, pale yellow to yellow fluorescence.
| === =1t p 10 0 STAd00 {[10e4 [ 5590 ppm CI 108
—— =T | 2 7 2665 ppm C2
MD 3021 —--‘I 1 === N > m) 0 0 < )Ce4 2190 ppm C3[14eg LIMESTONE: moderate yellowish brown (10YR
INC 1.25 \ —— —— [ h A 3209 ppm C4 5/4), locally very pale orange (10YR 8/2), firm to
cl 14 )/ rE===Iill=== \ B hard, blocky cuttings, micrite, less commonly
] ~ [\ == —— ] A peloidial, local vugs and fenestral porosity with
1 Y { 1/ 1 1 1 1 —F= T I- | 11 y .U 1 WL T T TY T 1 nil etainina foeciliferniie occa<inonal nvrit: 1




3 e pd LT J1J nodufes, salow streaming to cloudy I|gm 'b.iue cut,
= K = S light b
> S \ ght blue halo.
DST #1 Sy > () — e \[ N
3082'-3079' VARl f 0 \ . . .
15-60-60- 120 \ A, 3043 3040": dull to bright yellow fluorescence, light
. | ~ Y- [ X]1196u TG blue slow diffuse cut, patchy halo.
min { D A 21 6602 ppm C1_| ]
IH 1495 ] < p Z i 215 ppm C
IF40 J ( V ] 1] 131 ppm C3 LIMESTONE: light brownish gray (5YR 6/1) to
BOB 2min 2 L [ V4 5709 ppm Cd==m White (N9), hard to very hard, mudstone, local
ISI 758 { 4 N = A NN 1\ i i intraclasts, tight, pale yellow fluorescence, pale
BBnone > yellow cut, petroliferous odor.
FF 63 > o i ST o
BOB 1 sec G = — ZalVEE
FS1729 E | - 213u TG
f i ™~ ) 7770 ppm C1_| || SHALE: med light gray (N6) to dark greenish gra
BB none — = 4210 ppm C2_ || (5GY 4/1) to dark reddish brown (10R 3/4), mod
FH 1478 ‘, = " N N ) 3363 ppm C3 firm, platy to sub blocky cuttings, generally
J smooth, locally gritty/silty, locally calcareous.
Recovery: t N T S 5965 ppm C. y gritty/siity y reou
2170' GIP S ) e p>>
110' GOCM ( F T A \Y \ N ] 3070": yellow fluorescence, light blue streaming
ll / y ) > { cut, patchy halo.
6/10/2014 TS .48 Tri D Gas o LIMESTONE: white (N9), moderately hard,
00:00 s = m [T N\ \'I g 3080' MD- packstone or biolithite with interclastic porosity
\‘. 1l - ) 12980 TG | /1 stained with oil residue, vigorous reaction in HCI
WT 9.0 -+ > | \\ ( ] T T = T ( '/ 33415 ppml ct (.\l \ [ slow streaming blue cut, faint halo, strong
NN H
VS 61 / ) y il — ii=—— \ \ 28907 ppm C2 Bi)>) ™N petroliferous odor.
(T 4 y == == I J( 22711 ppm C3 7 3089’
) I f| A ll ==l =—— [ 45067 ppm C4 \ 355u TG LIMESTONE: mod yellowish brown (10YR 5/4),
| ) \ Al —— —— \ Vi 9717 ppm C locally very pale orange (10YR 8/2), firm, sub
,I \) 'l A Nl ==== === R []} [l 6935 ppm C2 blocky cuttings, mudstone to packstone,
= 1T L T 5617 ppm C. tight,occasional fossils, occasional light oil
o
R G S Hks o B (g1 13248 ppm C4--1] staining.
‘) { N = : - \Ill 3110 Missed Sample
WT 9.2 { i : - : [T & S 1] 3120": dull yellow fluorescence, occasional chip
VS 59 N | e — & has light blue slow streaming cut, patchy halo.
} = i — 1
| —— [ | F—"= [
l v II\ === L LIMESTONE: very pale orange (10YR 8/2) to
——1L —— DY) H grayish orange (10YR 7/4), hard, brittle
T T T T 3108 ' : '
\ ) *\\ / mM==== === / /A ligsuG mudstone, tight, occasional stylolite, no oil stain
{ 5 'S I I e — I(l ‘l 5536 ppm C reacts vigorously in HCI.
N G )] [ TTEA | [ =———= T] 3540 ppm C2 ]
{ AN : ——— | 11/ 2761 ppm C3_[ ||
N\ ] N3 D [[[THV— e e——— Va4 6684 ppm C4 SHALE: medium dark gray (N4) to black (N1),
— 4 N .
{ " | =P F—/—=] N [~ ANA moderately firm, locally calcareous, common
2011 I'd \ —— —_—— N | [ pyrite, common thin (< Imm) black lamina, no
{ { 1) [ ]] :HI = il === N \I fluorescence.
WT 9.2 ) AT T —— Z =
VS 59 | — e e ] —— P M~ N 3140': dull yellow fluorescence, light blue slow
= a0 ill=)= \/ —1 1] diffuse cut, patchy halo.
WOB 26 N || [ |[F— F o — — N
RPM 68 \ p= == === S N
PSI 1009 ( \ l‘ o —T— — = LIMESTONE: white (N9) to mod yellowish brown
SPM 54 ] \ I T —— " (10YR 5/4), sub blocky to platy, firm, micrite,
\ | N I\ ] ————— N i commonly fossiliferous, locally soft and chalky,
J il “_:_,_ILF = ) 3159' trace vug porosity with light oil staining,
Ve HH ' ' ] ' N T < 163u T
" $:::
\ = N - : == — 'Zi 4509 ppm C1-11 3170": dull yellow fluorescence, light blue slow
WT 9.3 < 7 HH n T € — 3408 ppm C2-— diffuse cut with occasional chip with light blue
{ ] ——— === N
VS 55 < y.d N = — N - zggi ppm 243:—' slow streaming cut, weak complete halo.
d 3 == ~ 5937 ppm C4T]
( D=l R LIMESTONE: white (N9) to med light gray (N6) to
e — e — S BINED) mod yellowish brown (10YR 5/4), micrite, hard,
TEPEYD——— BV )] N SO blocky, locally vuggy, no oil stains, locally
J N \ [ [TE—/— | [F——] p.2% A A fossiliferous, weak slow streaming pale yellow
P, : T (1] cut
{ r ] — T —— 1A
) 1 === n===== ip=2 1
( N1 A i I . I 1 T : £ ] | 3190' .
{ N [[[TF— = ——— B Pz 140u TG SHALE: med dark gray (N4) to a dark greenish
9 N~ T /] n —— || [=—— N 3593 ppm C1_[ [] 9ray (5G 4/1), platy to sub blocky, soft to mod
4 > A — T — T 3092 ppm C2_| [] firm, locally micaceous, locally calcareaous
\ 3 | : : y 2133 o ca [l
i —— [ [F——x mC3_L]
| \ | 1 €] — 1 ||| F/—D——4 | | <K < l-'.’)ﬁﬁggm ~ |11 |




0 Plighr) | 15000 | 5 (G (API 3 allpdr S L I =140 | [Shnlc DT] [ I Abkeep (ohmthn) N\ i
NO S0 sityPor 1 {l n e \l 1 r{p otlo.1 o J)) 10bo 10e4] 3200': pale yellow fluorescence, no cut, no halo.
0 Dbn Po. 1 ] | 1 T = idm lohid-m 0
6/11/2014 -+ 4/ 4 2 o | ’l | | | — — \ 1 0. ala kfa) 1H0- 1deo \L“l ad% 10b5 19ed
N N = [~ L 3 i -
00:00 [\ 1 d ) T % N ﬂt-r ST . LIMESTONE: )
n 3212' M : mottled pale yellowish brown (10YR
] { il —————1 - Jill S A PHEY Y b Uu Qﬁ ) W 237U TG ~1% 6/2) with very light gray (N8), mudstone, tight, fir
\ { 2 / l/ u ——T—— o b doo | 04!__5053 ppm Clrgag to hard, blocky, locally fossiliferous, locally
@ " {rt il % & i Dé?g ppm g‘ vuggy, rare intercrystal porosity.
/ N [/ [T REK —T—/—— | 10 0 doecle< [1gga | 3615 ppm Cd1g
{ AR BB —T——— ) A\ 9755 ppm C4
WT 9.4 ; \ ’] : L : % > ; } 3230": pale yellow fluorescence, no cut, weak
VS 53 f ¢ { mae== ——r—— \ {1 patchy halo.
) ) i :  — ———1- ) L L
| i L= — ——T— A ] \ LIMESTONE: white (N9) to med light gray (N6) to
[ - - > | — | —r—/—— | ] — | modyellowish brown (10YR 5/4), mudstone,
| —— W g e e o Y e e - [~ - ) }I locally crystalline, hard, locally soft and chalky,
<= 7 —T— — N i blocky, occasional vugs, no oil stains, locally
‘i 1 r‘ ¢ il = == i T fossiliferous, no fluorescence, no cut
) | | n —— | [E= [ )
WT 9.3 { I | w - L — ] [
3250 VS5l { Y / ) — i /] ! large angulr chert fragments in Arbuckle
g —— — = OTs L A
Arbuckle S X=p 11 i
DST #2 S e Nl 1] y frt 3255' MD DOLOMITE: white (N9) to buff, crystalli
3250'-3256' ) DI I Fpsas AITE: white (N9) to buff, crystalline,
15.60-60- 120 / 4 ( [ ] [elIdi sucrosic texture common, visible porosity, hard,
min \ \ \ || [[ ][] ) 2803 ppm CT vugs common, no stain in Alizarin Red, slow mild
IHI l631 ( 1] ] ld & 2169 ppm CZ reaction in HCI, weak petroliferous odor, dull
IF 301 ) i ! \\ \ }égg ppm gz yellow mineral flouorescence.
BOB 90 sec il il I
E‘éi%sne T e n L ) , } I p DOLOMITE: grayish orange (10YR 7/4), mudstone
FF 368 "'< 7 7 1 < A\ hard, tight, sub-blocky chips, no stain in Alizarin
BOB 8 min AN N il 1] ( \] { ‘] Red, no oil staining, slow mild reaction in HCI.
FSI 368 H H
BB none — / 1 / L i ;
{ | 11 VY 3280": bright yellow fluorescence, instant blue
FH 1588 { ( [ LS . ; .
i < ) 1 R > NS white slow streaming cut to cloudy cut, blue whi
1 11 halo.
Recovery: N | / | ) |
800" MCW S N (‘ | n } } } DOLOMITE: grayish orange (10YR 7/4), grainstor
& SoMCw K H H Y ) and sucrosic textures, hard, visible
N \‘K i 1 7/ £ v P porosity--interparticle and vug, moderate to
o~ 7 N i \Y \ NN significant oil staining, slow mild reaction in HCI,
WT 9.2 { S ] A ~ YA strong petroliferous odor.
VS 53 > { R S[ I — 7
d=="1 1 / I NIAEIAY
1 \ || 1] | { 3000': bright yellow flourescence, instant bright
/ s ||| ] ||| ] >\ ‘; 3308 M5 white blue fast streaming cut to milky cloud, full
p. 1] hite hal
\ DI 1} VI 226u 16 white halo
N \ L im im ) / (R 3437 ppm €
| N [ [ == [ ]} \INUTIN [ 5653 ppm c2 )
\ Pprd )] [ [—— ] NS ) ) 4352 ppm C DOLOMITE: grayish orange (10YR 7/4), hard,
> L4 A 1S ([ ][] { ST o0 me by sub-blocky, tight mudstone or wackestone,
\ | [T1T] [T1T] \ \ L Yt P occasional recrytallized oolitic-rich zones, no oil
/ im im { I{ staining, calcite fracture fill, chert nodules
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Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

SUMMARY

Berenergy Corporation ran 5 1/2” production casing in the vertical H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27 well to 3365’ TD in the
Cambrian-Ordovician Arbuckle Group. Onsite geologic services started at spud, and included examination of
drill cuttings and Pason total gas/chromatography. Two DSTs were run. DIL-GR-SP-CNL-CDL-CAL-MLL and
sonic logs were run from base of surface casing to TD. The primary objective was the Arbuckle. Secondary
objectives included sands in the Chase Group, the Tarkio Limestone and the Topeka Limestone, and limestones
in the Lansing-Kansas City Group.

Drilling

The surface hole was drilled with fresh water mud. The salty drilling fluid that resulted from drilling the
Hutchinson salt member of the Sumner Group at ~1000” was removed from the reserve pit. After 8 5/8” surface
casing was set at 1334, drilling with fresh water continued to 2530'. The remainder of the hole was drilled with
water-based mud. There were no problems with the hole during drilling, drill stem testing, logging, or casing.

Chase Group
Total gas increased from a background of 4-10 units to a peak of 252 units at the top of the Chase Group sands.
Maximum total gas of 277 units was recorded in gas show interval 1516° — 1536°. No liquid hydrocarbon shows
were observed.

Tarkio Limestone
Total gas increased from a background of 50-100 units to a peak of 1326 units at 2310’ in the lower Tarkio. No
liquid hydrocarbon shows were observed.

Topeka Limestone
Total gas increased from a background of 10-20 units to a peak of 183 units at the top of the Topeka. No liquid
hydrocarbon shows were observed.

Lansing—Kansas City Groups

Zones ‘A’ through ‘L’ were documented in this well. Overall, oil staining was limited to zones ‘D’, ‘I’, and “J’.
Total gas averaged 150-200 units. Maximum formation gas was 355 units in Zone “‘G’; trip gas was 1298 units.
Cut fluorescence ranged from slow streaming pale yellow to fast streaming blue-white. DST 1 recovered 2170
ft of gas in drill pipe on top of 110 ft of gas and oil-cut mud from combined zones ‘D’, ‘E” and ‘F’. The sampler
contained 4000 ml of 39.6° gravity oil and no water.

Arbuckle Group

The top of the Arbuckle was penetrated carefully. It was drilled 1 ft a time with each foot circulated before the
next was drilled. Drill cuttings from the top 6 ft of the Arbuckle, 3250° — 3256°, exhibited no oil show. Total
gas was ~100 units. DST 2 of the top 6 ft recovered 800 ft of mud-cut water and 6 ft of mud-cut water with an
oil skim. The sampler contained 2000 ml of water and no oil.

Drill cuttings from a second horizon roughly 60 ft into the Arbuckle had a strong petroleum odor, commonly
were oil-stained, displayed visible porosity and yielded cut fluorescence that was instant fast streaming bright
white-blue. Total gas increased to 226 units.

Ryan J. Thress
Consulting Wellsite Geologist
June 2014



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

OPERATOR:
WELL NAME:

SURFACE LOCATION:

LAT/LONG:
ELEVATIONS:
API NUMBER:

ROAD DIRECTIONS:

SURFACE CASING:
PRODUCTION CASING:
SPUD DATE:

DRILLING COMPLETED:
TOTAL DEPTH:

LAST FORMATION:

OPERATOR REPS:

WELLSITE SUPERVISION:

WELL DATA

Berenergy Corporation

H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

1270’ FNL & 1788’ FEL

SW SE NW NE Sec. 24, T20S, R11W

Barton County, Kansas

38.3007925°, -98.4855037°

GL 1749 KB 1759'

15-009-25868

From Great Bend, KS, E 16 miles on KS-96; S 4 miles on 2nd Rd; W 1
mile on Ave Q; N 0.7 mile on SE 160th Ave; W 0.3 mile on lease road to
location.

8 5/8" set at 1334

5 1/2" set at 3365'

June 4, 2014 01:45 hrs

June 12,2014  15:40 hrs

3365’ Driller 3363’ Logger

Arbuckle Group

Energy Operating Company Inc.

Dan Hall — Engineer

David Braden — Engineer

L. E. Ed Buchanan
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H. J. Roetzel 'A' 27

FORMATION TOPS

Formation Sample Top | Log Top Log Top Log Top Drilled
KB 1759 MD MD TVD Subsea Thickness
PERMIAN

Chase Group 1401 1398 1398 361

PENNSYLVANIAN -
Wabaunsee Group

Tarkio Ls 2262 2261 2261 -502 62

Shawnee Group

Topeka Ls 2580 2577 2577 -818 76

Oread Ls 2744 2741 2741 -982 103
Heebner Sh Mbr 2847 2844 2844 -1085 5
Toronto Ls Mbr 2853 2850 2850 -1091 29

Douglas Group 2882 2879 2879 -1120 91
Brown Lime 2973 2970 2970 -1211 5

Lansing-Kansas City Group -

Zone A 2990 2987 2987 -1228 16
Zone B 3006 3003 3003 -1244 14
Zone C 3020 3017 3017 -1258 13
Zone D 3033 3030 3030 -1271 23
Zone E 3056 3053 3053 -1294 9
Zone F 3065 3062 3062 -1303 15
Zone G 3080 3077 3077 -1318 52
Zone H 3132 3129 3129 -1370 16
Zone | 3148 3145 3145 -1386 19
ZoneJ 3167 3164 3164 -1405 41
Zone K 3208 3205 3205 -1446 29
Zone L 3237 3234 3234 -1475 13

CAMBRIAN-ORDOVICIAN -

Arbuckle Group 3250 3247 3247 -1488 115
Total Depth Driller 3365
Total Depth Logger 3363 3363 -1604

Geologic ages from:
Moore et al. (1951); The Kansas rock column (No. 89-93). University of Kansas Publications.



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel 'A' 27

LITHOLOGY AND SHOWS

The following descriptions are interpretive. Derrick hands collected lagged 30-ft samples 1390° - 1840’; no
samples 1840’ - 2200’; 30-ft samples 2200’ - 2350’; no samples 2350° - 2570’ and 10-ft samples 2570 - 3365’
TD, along with spot samples to constrain select tops and when drilling activities dictated. Samples were
reviewed with the aid of wireline logs from 1334' to 3365' TD, and wireline logs were adjusted down 3 feet on
the Wellsite Geologist’s Composite Log to match driller’s depths.

Samples were inspected using an Olympus SZ61 stereoscope. Grain sizes were determined by use of an
AmStrat grain size comparator. Colors of wet cuttings were determined from the Rock-Color Chart distributed
by the Geological Society of America. 10% HCI was used in acid reaction tests, and Alizarin red was used to
aid with carbonate species determination.

Selected samples were examined for oil fluorescence with a US GeoSupply brand fluoroscope. Cut tests for
liquid hydrocarbons were performed with solvent on wet cuttings. All samples collected were drilled with fresh
water and water-based mud and sieved and rinsed in fresh water.

Significant gas shows, as determined with a Pason Gas Analyzer (TG; C1-C4), are described in each formation
overview. The reader may also refer to the accompanying Wellsite Geologist’s Composite Log for the complete
record of lagged mud log gas correlated to wireline log data.

Surface Casing: 8 5/8" set at 1334"; +425' subsea
CHASE GROUP SAMPLE TOP: 1401 LOG: 1398’ TVD: 1398’ SUBSEA: +361°
Overview: The topmost group of Wolfcampian beds is made up of prominent escarpment-

making sands, limestones, and shales. The shale units are predominantly gray and
massive, though locally characterized by shades of reds and greens. Chert or flint-
bearing limestones are included in this division. The Chase group sands are known
for gas shows in this area. Samples 1390'-1810' are all medium-sand sized (250-
500p) chips and sand grains and contain abundant iron filings; cuttings are too small
for complete and thorough descriptions. Only rock type is barely discernible.
Occasionally there exists a coarse-grained chip.

1401' — 1840' SHALE: light olive gray to greenish gray, soft, occasional millimeter-sized platy
cuttings, some zones very calcarcous, others non calcareous, without significant
difference in appearance, rare pyrite nodules; CHERT: white to clear, hard,
conchoidal fracture, no reaction with HCl; LIMESTONE: white (N9), sub-
millimeter sized chips, rounded, strong reaction in HCI; SANDSTONE: clear to
white (N9), soft to firm, subrounded medium to coarse-grained sand sized chips
composed of very fine to fine-grained sand, typically a lime sandstone, commonly
micaceous, calcite cemented; SHALE: medium light gray (N6) to dark greenish gray
(5GY 4/1) to dark reddish brown (10R 3/4), moderate firm, platy, generally smooth,
locally gritty/silty, locally calcareous.

1840° - 2200’ No samples collected.



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel 'A' 27

LITHOLOGY AND SHOWS

RICHARDSON GROUP SAMPLE TOP: N/A' LOG: N/A' TVD: N/A' SUBSEA: N/A'

Overview:

2200'— 2262

TARKIO LS

Overview:

2262'—2350'

2350’ - 2570°

TOPEKA LS
SHAWNEE GROUP

Overview:

The Richardson Subgroup comprises the youngest Pennsylvanian rocks of the
Wabaunsee Group and includes strata from the top of the Brownville limestone to
the top of the Tarkio limestone. Samples were caught at the base of the Richardson
Subgroup to identify the transition into the Tarkio limestone. The Richardson is
predominately red and green shale with silty lenses and limestone stringers. Total
gas increased from a background of 40-60 units to a peak of 388 units within the
sampled section. No oil shows were observed.

SHALE: med dark gray (N4) to a dark greenish gray (5G 4/1), platy to sub blocky,
long thin blades common, soft to mod firm, locally micaceous, calcareous; with
SHALE: dark reddish brown (10R 3/4) to very dusky red (10R 2/2), platy, soft,
moderately strong reaction to HCI, fully decrepitates in HCl; SHALE: dark greenish
gray (5GY 4/1), soft, platy to sub blocky, moderate reaction to HCI; local lenses of
SILTSTONE: medium gray (N5) to medium dark gray (N4), sub blocky, soft, gritty
with local areas of high clay content, moderately reacts to HCI; with stringers of
LIMESTONE: very light gray (N8) to light gray (N7), platy to sub blocky, firm to
moderately hard, brittle, very reactive to HCI.

SAMPLE TOP: 2262 LOG: 2261 TVD: 2261 SUBSEA: -502'

The Tarkio limestone is youngest member of the Nemaha Subgroup of the
Wabaunsee Group. It is gray to weathered brown and commonly consists of two
massive beds separated by a shaly zone. Fossils are very common, especially
fusulinids. Algal remains are present in the upper bed. Total gas increased from a
background of 50-100 units to a peak of 1326 units. No oil shows were observed.

LIMESTONE: very light gray (N8) to light gray (N7), platy to sub blocky, firm to
moderately hard, brittle, very reactive to HCI; yellow fluorescence, slow diffuse pale
yellow cut, splotchy halo; with SHALE: medium gray (N5) to medium dark gray
(N4), very soft, platy to sub rounded, no to slight reaction in HCI; and CHERT:
white to clear, hard, commonly large, well-rounded grains, conchoidal fracture, no
reaction with HCIL.

No samples collected.

SAMPLE TOP: 2580 LOG: 2577 TVD: 2577 SUBSEA: -818’

The Shawnee Group is part of the Upper Pennsylvanian Series and comprises four
limestone formations and three shale formations. Thick limestones and a distinctive
type of cyclic sedimentation are characteristics that distinguish these rocks from



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel 'A' 27

2580'—-2678'
2678'— 2681
2681'—2699'
2699'—2702'
2702' - 2740'
2740'— 2744
OREAD LS

2744' - 2847

LITHOLOGY AND SHOWS

those of neighboring groups. The shale formations are 2-6 ft thick. Total gas
increased from a background of 10-20 units to a peak of 183 units at the top of
Topeka Limestone. No hydrocarbon shows were observed.

LIMESTONE: mottled white (N9) to light gray (N7) to buff, crystalline and algal
limestone common, blocky, firm to very hard, locally fossiliferous, no visible
porosity, vigorous reaction to HCI, firm to hard, smells strongly of sulfur while
reacting with HCI; LIMESTONE: light gray (N7) to bluish white (5B 9/1) mottled
with medium dark gray (N4), firm to very hard, blocky to sub-blocky, crystalline,
fossiliferous, vigorous reaction to HCl; SHALE: dark reddish brown (10R 3/4) to
very dusky red (10R 2/2), platy, soft, locally gritty appearance, moderately strong
reaction to HCI, fully decrepitates in HCl; SHALE: dark greenish gray (5GY 4/1),
soft, platy to sub blocky, moderate reaction to HCI. Cuts: 2610’ no fluorescence, no
cut, no halo; 2640’ dull yellow fluorescence, no cut, no halo; 2670’ pale yellow
fluorescence, slow diffuse pale yellow cut, no halo.

SHALE: medium dark gray (N4) to black (N1), firm, platy cuttings, slightly
calcareous, no fluorescence.

Second LIMESTONE: pale yellowish brown (10YR 6/2) to very light gray (N8),
firm, sub blocky cuttings, mudstone to wackestone texture, unidentifiable fossil
debris, no visible porosity, argillaceous, very dull yellow fluorescence, yellow

diffuse cloudy cut. Cut 2720’: dull yellow fluorescence, no cut, splotchy incomplete
halo.

SHALE: medium gray (N5) to medium dark gray (N4), firm, platy cuttings, slightly
calcareous, no fluorescence.

Third LIMESTONE: yellowish gray (5Y 8/1), hard, sub-blocky, wackestone, local
calcite lined vug porosity, rare fracture porosity with residual stain, vigorous
reaction in HCI with strong odor sulfurous odor; pale yellow with splotches of
yellow mineral fluorescence, pale yellow diffuse cut.

SHALE: med dark gray (N4) to dark gray (N3), platy and elongated, firm and
brittle, locally very silty, strong reaction to HCI; also occasionally a very dusky red
(10R 2/2), higher silt content, soft, slightly calcareous.

SAMPLE TOP: 2744’ LOG: 2741° TVD: 2741° SUBSEA: -982°

Fourth LIMESTONE: med light gray (N6), occurs as blocky cuttings, mudstone,
locally streaked with medium dark gray (N4) argillaceous material, no fluorescence;
LIMESTONE: yellowish gray (5Y 8/1), firm to moderately hard, blocky cuttings,
mudstone to wackestone, commonly fossiliferous, occasional fracture porosity with
residual stain, occasional chert fragments, pale dull yellow fluorescence. Cuts: 2760’
very slow diffuse cut, splotchy, incomplete, very pale yellow residual halo; 2800’
pale yellow with splotches of yellow mineral fluorescence, pale yellow diffuse cut;
2840’ pale yellow mineral fluorescence, pale yellow diffuse cut, patchy halo.
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HEEBNER SH MBR

2847'— 2853

TORONTO LS MBR

2853'— 2882

DOUGLAS GROUP

Overview:

2882'—2973'

BROWN LIME

Overview:

2973'-2978'

2978'—2990'

LITHOLOGY AND SHOWS

SAMPLE TOP: 2847 LOG: 2844’ TVD: 2844’ SUBSEA: -1085’
SHALE: grayish black (N2) to black (N1), platy, firm and brittle, waxy yet with a

slightly gritty appearance, weak reaction to HCI.

SAMPLE TOP: 2853’ LOG 2850’ TVD: 2850’ SUBSEA: -1091”
LIMESTONE: very pale orange (10YR 8/2), occurs as ~Imm subangular chips,
firm to hard, locally fossiliferous, reacts vigorously to HCI; pale yellow

fluorescence, pale yellow cut.

SAMPLE TOP: 2882 LOG: 2879' TVD: 2879’ SUBSEA: -1120°
The Douglas Group conformably underlies the Shawnee Group. It consists primarily
of clastic rocks, mostly shale. Limestones are quantitatively of minor importance. No

significant oil or gas shows; background gas averaged 40-50 units.

Predominantly SHALE: moderate brown (SYR 3/4), moderately soft, platy to sub
blocky cuttings, gritty, silty, calcareous, no fluorescence; SHALE: dark greenish
gray (5GY 4/1), soft, platy to sub blocky, moderate reaction to HCI; SHALE: light
gray (N6) to med. dark gray (N4), sub blocky, very soft, waxy, micaceous, locally
silty with gritty appearance, no reaction to a moderate reaction in HCIl, sample
mainly consists of armored mud balls—unconsolidated clay balls with rock chips;
with minor stringers of LIMESTONE: very pale orange (10YR 8/2), occurs as
~1mm subangular chips, firm to hard, locally fossiliferous, reacts vigorously to HCI.
Cut 2920’: occasional pale yellow mineral fluorescence, no cut, no halo.

SAMPLE TOP: 2973 LOG: 2970' TVD: 2970’ SUBSEA: -1211”

Marker bed right above the Lansing-Kansas City Group. The limestone is commonly
dark brown and very hard, easily seen on engineering data. Included in this section is
the shale that separates the Brown Lime and the Lansing-Kansas City Group. No

significant gas or oil shows were observed.

LIMESTONE: dark yellowish brown (10YR 4/2), blocky, angular, very hard,
dense, crystalline, locally fossiliferous, reacts vigorously to HCI.

SHALE: medium gray (N5) to medium dark gray (N4), firm, platy cuttings, slightly
calcareous, no fluorescence; with SILTSTONE: medium gray (N5) to medium dark
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LANSING-KANSAS

CITY GROUP
Overview:
2990' - 3006'
3006'—3020'
3020'-3033'
3033'—-3056'
3056'—3065'
3065'—3080'

LITHOLOGY AND SHOWS

gray (N4), sub blocky, soft, gritty with local areas of high clay content and locally
micaceous, slight to no reaction in HCI. Cut 2980°: no mineral fluorescence, slow
streaming light blue cut, incomplete halo.

SAMPLE TOP: 2990’ LOG: 2987 TVD: 2987 SUBSEA: -1228’

The Lansing-Kansas City Group contains 12 limestone formations (zones ‘A’
through ‘L) alternating with marine shale units and has a thickness of about 260 feet
at this location. Many of the limestones are cross-bedded, oolitic, and algal. Overall,
oil staining was limited to zones ‘D’, ‘I’, and ‘J’. Total gas averaged 150-200 units.
Maximum formation gas was 355 units in Zone ‘G’; trip gas was 1298 units. Cut
fluorescence ranged from slow streaming pale yellow to fast streaming blue-white.
DST 1 recovered 2170 ft of gas in drill pipe on top of 110 ft of gas and oil-cut mud
from combined zones ‘D’, ‘E’ and ‘F’. The sampler contained 4000 ml of 39.6°
gravity oil and no water.

Zone A; LIMESTONE: white (N9) to grayish orange (10YR 7/4), hard, sub blocky
cuttings, fossiliferous, subhedral pyrite, rare vugs, locally a packstone but more
commonly dense mudstone, local oil staining, pale yellow to yellow fluorescence.
Cut 3000°: dull yellow to rare bright yellow mineral fluorescence, slow streaming
pale yellow cut, incomplete halo.

Zone B; LIMESTONE: white (N9) to grayish orange (10YR 7/4), hard, sub blocky
cuttings, fossiliferous, subhedral pyrite, rare vugs, locally a packstone but more
commonly dense mudstone, local oil staining, pale yellow to yellow fluorescence;
SHALE: medium gray (N5), firm platy chips and bit scrapings, locally silty, non-
calcareous, silty chips remain intact in H2O, no fluorescence.

Zone C; LIMESTONE: moderate yellowish brown (10YR 5/4), locally very pale
orange (10YR 8/2), firm to hard, blocky cuttings, micrite, less commonly peloidal,
local vugs and fenestral porosity with oil staining, fossiliferous, occasional pyrite
nodules. Cut: slow streaming to cloudy light blue cut, light blue halo.

Zone D; LIMESTONE: light brownish gray (SYR 6/1) to white (N9), hard to very
hard, mudstone, local intraclasts, tight, pale yellow fluorescence, pale yellow cut,
petroliferous odor. Cut 3040’: dull to bright yellow fluorescence, light blue slow
diffuse cut and patchy halo.

Zone E; LIMESTONE: light brownish gray (5YR 6/1) to white (N9), hard to very
hard, mudstone, local intraclasts, tight, pale yellow fluorescence, pale yellow cut,
petroliferous odor. SHALE: med light gray (N6) to dark greenish gray (5GY 4/1) to
dark reddish brown (10R 3/4), mod firm, platy to sub blocky cuttings, generally
smooth, locally gritty/silty, locally calcareous.

Zone F; LIMESTONE: white (N9), moderately hard, packstone or biolithite with
interclastic porosity stained with oil residue, vigorous reaction in HCI, slow
streaming blue cut, faint halo, strong petroliferous odor. Cut 3070’: yellow
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3080' —3132'
3132'-3148'

3148' - 3167

3167' —3208'

3208' —3237"
3237'—3250"
ARBUCKLE GROUP
Overview:

LITHOLOGY AND SHOWS

fluorescence, light blue streaming cut and patchy halo.

Zone G; A thick sequence of LIMESTONE: mod yellowish brown (10YR 5/4),
locally very pale orange (10YR 8/2), firm, sub blocky cuttings, mudstone to
packstone, tight, occasional fossils, occasional light oil staining. LIMESTONE:
very pale orange (10YR 8/2) to grayish orange (10YR 7/4), hard, brittle, mudstone,
tight, occasional stylolite, no oil stain, reacts vigorously in HCL. Cut 3120°: dull
yellow fluorescence, occasional chip has light blue slow streaming cut, patchy halo.

Zone H; LIMESTONE: white (N9) to mod yellowish brown (10YR 5/4), sub
blocky to platy, firm, mudstone, commonly fossiliferous, locally soft and chalky,
trace vug porosity with light oil staining. SHALE: medium dark gray (N4) to black
(N1), moderately firm, locally calcareous, common pyrite, common thin (< 1mm)
black lamina, no fluorescence. Cut 3140’: dull yellow fluorescence, light blue slow
diffuse cut, patchy halo.

Zone [; LIMESTONE: white (N9) to mod yellowish brown (10YR 5/4), sub blocky
to platy, firm, mudstone, commonly fossiliferous, locally soft and chalky, trace vug
porosity with light oil staining.

Zone J; LIMESTONE: white (N9) to medium light gray (N6) to moderate yellowish
brown (10YR 5/4), mudstone, hard, blocky, locally vuggy, no oil stains, locally
fossiliferous, weak slow streaming pale yellow cut; SHALE: med dark gray (N4) to
a dark greenish gray (5G 4/1), platy to sub blocky, soft to moderately firm, locally
micaceous, locally calcareous. Cut 3170’: dull yellow fluorescence, light blue slow

diffuse cut with occasional chip with light blue slow streaming cut, weak complete
halo.

Zone K; LIMESTONE: mottled pale yellowish brown (10YR 6/2) with very light
gray (N8), mudstone, tight, firm to hard, blocky, locally fossiliferous, locally vuggy,
rare intercrystalline porosity. Cut 3230°: pale yellow fluorescence, no cut, weak
patchy halo.

Zone L; LIMESTONE: white (N9) to med light gray (N6) to moderate yellowish
brown (10YR 5/4), mudstone, locally crystalline, hard, locally soft and chalky,
blocky, occasional vugs, no oil stains, locally fossiliferous, no fluorescence, no cut.

SAMPLE TOP: 3250’ LOG: 3247 TVD: 3247 SUBSEA: -1488’

The Arbuckle Dolomite (Cambrian-Ordovician) is composed mostly of light gray to
white, vuggy and sucrosic dolomite. The top of the Arbuckle was penetrated
carefully. It was drilled 1 ft a time with each foot circulated before the next was
drilled. Drill cuttings from the top 6 ft of the Arbuckle, 3250’ — 3256°, exhibited no
oil show. Total gas was ~100 units. DST 2 of the top 6 ft recovered 800 ft of mud-
cut water and 6 ft of mud-cut water with an oil skim. The sampler contained 2000 ml
of water and no oil.
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3250'-3365'TD

LITHOLOGY AND SHOWS

DOLOMITE: white (N9) to buff, crystalline, sucrosic texture common, visible
porosity, hard, vugs common, no stain in Alizarin Red, slow mild reaction in HCI,
weak petroliferous odor, dull yellow mineral fluorescence; DOLOMITE: grayish
orange (10YR 7/4), mudstone, hard, tight, sub-blocky chips, no stain in Alizarin
Red, no oil staining, slow mild reaction in HCl. DOLOMITE: grayish orange
(10YR 7/4), grainstone and sucrosic textures, hard, visible porosity--interparticle and
vug, moderate to significant oil staining, slow mild reaction in HCI, strong
petroliferous odor. DOLOMITE: grayish orange (10YR 7/4), hard, sub-blocky,
tight mudstone or wackestone, occasional recrystallized oolitic-rich zones, no oil
staining, calcite fracture fill, chert nodules common, occasional pyrite, slow mild
reaction in HCl, no stain in Alizarin Red. Cut 3280’: bright yellow fluorescence,
instant blue white slow streaming cut to cloudy cut, blue white halo. Cut 3000’:
bright yellow fluorescence, instant bright white blue fast streaming cut to milky
cloud, full white halo.

10



RILOBITE

DRILL STEM TEST REPORT

ESTING , N

PO Box 5850
Denver, CO 80217

ATIN: Ed Buchanan

Beren Energy Corpoyation

24-205-11W Barton

Roetzel A 27
Job Ticket: 58994 DST#:1
Test Start: 2014.06.10 @ 05:07:47

GENERAL INFORMATION:

11

Formation: Lansing Kansas City
Deviated: No Whipstock: . ft (KB) Test Type: Conventional Bottom Hole (Initial)
Time Tool Opened: 07:50:17 Tester: Leal Cason
Time Test Ended: 14:44:32 Unit No: 74
Interval: 3032.00 ft (KB) To  3079.00 ft (KB) (TVD) Reference Bevations: 1759.00 ft (KB)
Total Depth: 3079.00 ft (KB) (TVD) 1749.00 ft(CF)
Hole Diameter: 7.88 inchesHole Condition: Goed KB to GR/CF: 10.00 ft
Serial #: 8367 Qutside
Press@RunDepth: 63.27 psig @ 3033.00 ft (KB) Capacity: 8000.00 psig
Start Date: 2014.06.10 End Date: 2014.06.10 Last Calib.: 2014.06.10
Start Time: 05:07:47 End Time: 14:44:32 Tire On Btm: 2014.06.10 @ 07:49:47
Time Off Btm:
TEST COMMENT: IF: Strong Blow, BOB in 2 minutes
ISk No Blow Back
FF: Strong Blow, BOB immediate
FSk: No Blow Back
PRESSURE SUMMARY
- 5 Time Pressure| Temp | Annotation
1. (Min) (psig) | (degF)
} l { ] 0| 1495.55 99.45 | Initial Hydro-static
- R 1° 1 30.98 | 99.27 | Open To Flow (1)
N 1. 16| 39.87 | 100.15| Shut-ih(1)
" "n } } | \ax O 77 757.99 101.19 | End Shut-In(1)
2 | ? f } { : 7‘1 -3 78| 4255 | 100.72 Open To Flow (2)
§mi i mon | g 137 | 6327 | 101.07 | Shut-hn(2)
* I f | | E ] g 257 728.58 102.16 | End Shut-in(2)
-l % } : 1= 250 | 1478.15 | 101.86 | End Shut-in(3)
ar iR/ EN
= Iy | | [ 1.
‘ | E|
Ll : - - — -
0 Raind¥ - - v §Hors) i b
Recowery ‘ Gas Rates
Length () Description Volume (bbl) I Choke (inches) 'Pressure (psig) lGasRate(Mcfld) J
0.00 2170 GP 0.00
110.00 GOCM 15%G 15%0 70%M 1.54
Trilobite Testing, Inc Ref. No: 58994 Printed: 2014.06.10 @ 14:58:36
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Serial #: 8367 Outside Beren Energy Corporation Roetzel A 27 DST Test Number: 1
Pressure vs. Time
[v] [+
8367 Pressure 8367 Temperature
[~ ’ Jn{ﬁal Hydro-statil: ] ' b
1500 [ L | SIS ) };
| . W
. Ky N
n | _ | 100
- | | ' %W? 3‘13%
| I 3 N
1250 - ! ‘ j4 Y
_ 1 { i3 7Y 95
B | | % | ¥
- e 1 ! N v %
- E | | ¥ B EE X
1000 . | | ¥ Sa— =
- y | | ! [ 3
2 : | | | b4 | 85 @
L |- | : ' 2
o B | . | L 5
34 750 & ; ‘ nd Shut-in{1} ; {;? ,qi
/ R | | i Q
i 1 ! |
500 ; ; »‘ 75
B ! |
¥ | |
- F | | 70
™ | E i |
250 }\ = f ;
- \ z | |
W ; [ !
u — | 65
0 m ;‘ h{i&?ff)’(ﬂ Shut-in(2)
B6AM 9AM 3PM
10 Tue Jun 2014 Time (Hours)

Trilobite Testing, Inc

Ref. No: 58994
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Printed: 2014.06.10 @ 14:58:37
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9\ TRILOBITE TESTING, INC.

}1  P.O. Box 362 * Hays, Kansas 67601

Ticket No.

FLUID SAMPLER DATA

59954

Date &4 10 /Y

Company Name 5 €7 €1 ,f NEYGYy Colpoiu] s on

Lease [N6CT=ze| A 2.7

County gﬁf’z’{s s

. Gas

SAMPLER RECOVERY

2"’?‘0‘? CuFT e ML

Oil C Nooe ML
Mud ML
Water ML
Other ML
Pressure | foo ;35:2' ML
Tofal Hooo L
SAMPLER ANALYSIS
Resistivity ohms @ SF.
Chlorides ppm
| ‘G“ravity

J9.6 corrected;@ﬁOF

ppm. .

Test No. i
Sec. _# Twp. il Rng. _/7¢r
- PIT MUD ANALYSIS

Chlorides 16 0¢ “ppm.
Resistivity_ @ /¢ ohms @ F
Viscosity

Mud Weight _“1. ©

Filtrate __ g.4

Other

PIPE RECOVERY
TOP )
Resistivity YC ‘ ohms @ _F
S

Chiorides Al L . ppm.
MIDDLE )

‘Resistivity v ohms @ .

Chlorides /i< ppm.
BOTTOM .

Resistivity 4L ohms @ F

JL

Chlorides __//

13
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PILOBITE DRILL STEM TEST REPORT

Berenergy Corporation 24-20S-11W Barton
ESTIN G ,INC. PO Box 5850 Roetzel A 27

Denver, CO 80217 Job Ticket: 58995 DST#:2

ATTN: Ed Buchanan Test Start: 2014.06.11 @ 16:41:24
GENERAL INFORMATION:
Formation: Arbuckle o .
Deviated: No Whipstock; ft (KB) Test Type:  Conventional Bottom Hole (Reset)
Tirne Tool Opened: 18:17:09 Tester: Leal Cason
Time Test Ended: 08:26:24 Unit No: 74
Interval: 3250.00 ft (KB) To  3257.00 ft (KB) (TVD) Reference Bevations: 1759.00 ft (KB)
Total Depth: 3256.50 ft (KB) (TVD) 1749.00 ft (CF)

-1 Hole Diameter: 7.88 inchesHole Condition: Good KB to GRICF: 10.00 ft

Serial #: 6798 Inside
Press@RunDepth: 367.59 psig @ 3250.50 ft (KB) Capacity: 8000.00 psig
Start Date: 2014.06.11 . End Date: 2014.06.12 Last Calib.: 2014.06.12
Start Time: 16:41:24 End Time: 08:26:24  Time On Btn 2014.06.11 @ 18:08:09

Time Off Bt 2014.06.11 @ 22:36:09

TEST COMMENT: IF: Strong Blow , BOB in 90 seconds
ISt No Blow Back
FF: Weak Blow, Built to 6 inches by 8 minutes, Dead @ 25 minutes
FS!: No Blow Back

. Pressure vs. Thme = PRESSURE SUMMARY
™ e = - Time Pressure| Temp | Annotation
: i —— i (Min.) (psig) | (degP)
- I ~ : 0| 1630.67 | 106.02| initial Hydro-static
: ! o 9| 105.84 | 106.98|Open To Flow(1)
=] ; 25| 301.05 | 108.12] Shut-in(1)
|

367.61 108.10 | End Shut-In(1)

z ‘ l i 86| 30361 | 108.07|Open To Flow(2)
: f | % __.g 146 | 367.59 | 108.07 | Shut-n(2)
£om ] : I 266 | 368.18 | 108.05| End Shut-in(2)

/ | 2 : Bt 268 | 1587.85 | 107.88 | Final Hydro-static

——
Lt
r_
e 8
o]
(31

H Wi An e i (s

Recowery Gas Rates

Length (1) . Description Volurme (bbl) _ I Choke (irches) l Pressure (pslg) | Gas Rate (Mcfid)
800.00 MCW 20%M 80%W 1 122
6.00 SOMCW 1%0 24%M 75%W 0.08
* Recoveryfrom multiple tests

Trilobite Testing, Inc Ref. No: 58995 : Printed: 2014.06.12 @ 08:39:21
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DST Test Number: 2

Serial #: 6798 inside Berenergy Corporation Roetzel A 27
Pressure vs. Time _
Lyl [¥]
6798 Pressure 6798 Temperature
1750 ; ] — ! A 110
_ 105
1500
» 100
1250
» 95
i —
= o)
— - 3
B 1000 90 3
w -~
< - o
~ c
g B o
2 - 85 7
@ ®
o 750 Q
o - 3
i 80
500
L 75
End Shut-In(2
250 70
65

11 Wed Jun 2014

9PM

12 Thu
Time (Hours)

3AM

6AM 9AM

Trilobite Testing, Inc

Ref. No: 58995

15

Frinted: 2014.06.12 @ 08:39:21
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1) TRILOBITE TESTING, INC.

P.O. Box 362 Hays Kansas 67601

e ‘ , | FLUID SAMPLER DATA
'TiC,"‘et No. 55”67?5" = _ Date (“*é//////‘/

Company Name E@V{."}‘) é’%gjy’ (/C"/ 2OV Crrl) 0’7 ‘

Lease //X"O“(”TZV I A2 7 TestNo. _ 2

County !,?d?”‘? on o . ' Sec. ~ 2H - Twp. 205 _ Rng. //4‘/

SAMPLER ’REC:’OV’ERY PIT MUD ANALYSIS‘

Gas R 22 ».9"%"1 o FT 0 N Chlorides _ SOCC o - ppm. -

ol RN S ML  Resistivity A7 < ohms@ sl . F o

ML Viscosity _ &2 o

2000 L _ ML Mud Weight ?‘?.3~

7.9

ML Filtrate

Pressure o Qﬁ”*’,@’ﬂgf : S ML Other _

'I.'otalu » v 120@0‘ : M

SAMPLER ANALYSIS | ~ PIPE RECOVERY

\

Resistivity M7 ohmse €1 cF toP - ST
R o Resistivity __« 16 ohms @ _ go _F

~ Chlorides . R | 7’@-@? . "'ppm.

Chlorides - - V_I /7000 "‘ppm., .‘

I R ~ mopLe PR R
Gravity VAL _ corrected @BOF " Resistivity AE omse _ 6O  ° F

Chorides ______~ ) 7¢0ns ___ppm.

BOTTOM L |
Resistivity 16 ohms @ be  F

‘e Chlorides _____ 17060 '.Ppmf-f’

16 .
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Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

CONTRACTOR:
SUPERVISION:

WELLSITE GEOLOGY:

RIG INSTRUMENTATION:

WIRELINE SERVICES:

DRILLING FLUIDS:

DRILLSTEM TESTING:

CASING:

CEMENT:

SERVICES

Val Energy Rig 6
L. E. Ed Buchanan

T. M. McCoy & Co., Inc.
Ryan J. Thress

Pason Systems
Pioneer Energy Services
Dale Legleiter

Mudco
Jason Whiting

Trilobite Testing, Inc.
Andy Carriera

Murray Casing Crews Inc.

Allied Oil & Gas Services
Wayne Davis

17

Wichita, KS
661-204-2565

Wilson, WY
307-733-4332

Golden, CO
877-255-3158

Hays, KS
785-625-3858

Great Bend, KS
620-282-0556

Hays, KS
785-625-4778

Great Bend, KS
620-793-7587

Great Bend, KS
620-793-5861



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

DAILY OPERATIONS

Day Report Depth FtCut Start End Hrs Reported Activity (previous 24 hr leading to 6 AM report time)

Date
1 2-Jun 0 0 12:00 13:.00 1.00 MIRU skid camp house
13:30  20:30 7.00 Wait on 2nd truck load with generator, potable water tank, septic system. (2nd truck broke
down at Hoistington, KS).
2 3-Jun 0 0 06:00 10:00 4.00 Unload 2nd truck with generator, potable water tank, septic system onto 1st truck at
Hoisington, KS. Mobe to Reotzel A 27.
10:00 17:00  7.00 Set in & rig up potable water tank, generator, septic system. Rig down potable water tank &
fill half full with well water for Roetzel A 27 lease. Set in potable water tank & rig up.
3 4-Jun 0 0 06:00 07:30 1.50 Wait for Val Rig 6 to mobe in loads on Roetzel A 27 location.
07:30 16:00 8.50 MIRU Val Rig 6. Rig up trucks left location at 16:00 hrs 6/3/2014.
16:00 23:.00 7.00 Send rotary table to machine shop for repairs. Continue rig up equipment to drill.
23:00 6:00 7.00 Dry watch rig.
4 5-Jun 345 345 06:00 07:00 1.00 Dry watch rig.
07:00 12:30 5.50 Replacement rotary table arrived 12:30 hrs.
12:30 01:00 12.50 Install replacement rotary table, mounts, floor plates, & chain guard w/ welders.
01:00 01:45 0.75 Drill rat & mouse holes.
01:45 03:30 1.75 Drill 12 1/4" hole 0' - 194",
03:30 03:45 0.25 Calibrate Pason.
03:45 05:15 150 Drill 194" - 315",
05:15 05:45 0.50 Circulate. Survey 315'--0.25 deg.
05:45 06:00 0.25 Drill 315" - 345",
5 6-Jun 1285 940 06:00 10:00 4.00 Drill 345' - 620'.

10:00 10:30 0.50 Circulate. Survey 620'--0.75 deg.
10:30 16:30  6.00 Drill 620" - 901"

16:30 17:.00 0.50 Service rig. Survey 901'--0.25 deg.
17:.00 02:30 9.50 Drill 901" - 1215'.

02:30 03:00 0.50 Repair geolograph line.

03:00 06:00 3.00 Drill 1215' - 1285'".

18



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

DAILY OPERATIONS

Day Report Depth FtCut Start End Hrs Reported Activity (previous 24 hr leading to 6 AM report time)

Date
6 7-Jun 1334 49 06:00 08:30 250 Drill 1285' - 1334

08:30 09:00 0.50 Circulate 2x bottoms up.

09:00 12:00 3.00 Wiper trip to bit, drop survey, strap drill pipe out. Kelly up at 90', work off drilling ring.

12:00 13:30 1.50 Clean off bit, remove survey tool. Trip in to 1334". Survey 1334'--0.75 deg.

13:30 14:.00 0.50 Circulate 2x bottoms up.

14:00 1530 1.50 Trip out to run surface casing.

15:30 21:30 6.00 Safety meeting w/ rig crew & casing crew. Run 1338.73' 31 jts 8 5/8" J-55 24# ST& C 8rd
casing. Shoe set at 1334'; float collar at 1288.51". Work casing thru gravel 90' - 420'. Rig
down casing crew.

21:30 22:30 1.00 Safety meeting w/ rig crew & cementers. Circulate and reciprocate casing 20 ft.

22:30 00:30 2.00 Rig up cement head & lines. Test lines to 3000psi, pump 5bbls water ahead followed by
689.5/ft3 or 350sx Lead cement: Density=12.5ppg Yield=1.97 ft3/sx Water=10.7 gal/sx.
Followed by 351/ft3 or 300sx Tail cement: Density=14.8ppg Yield=1.17 ft3/sx Water=6.4
gal/sx. Shut down, release wiper plug, displace with 82.25bbls fresh water. Bump plug with
1360psi with 890psi prior. Hold 1360psi for 5 minutes, release pressure, floats held (ok) CIP
@ 00:09hrs 6/7/2014 Received 14bbls cement returns back to surface. R/D cementers.
Monitor cement for fall back. No cement fall back on surface iob.

00:30 06:00 5.50 Wait on cement 12 hrs.

7 8Jun 1453 119 06:00 12:00 6.00 Wait on cement.

12:00 13:30 1.50 Break out 8 5/8" landing joint. Install Larkin well head. Nipple up BOPE.

13:30 15:30 2.00 Make up bit 2 & BHA. Trip in to 1270'".

15:30  19:00 3.50 Test BOP. Adapter union leaking, remove, tighten several times, constantly leaking. Adapter
union is worn out.

19:00 20:30 1.50 Trip out to repair BOPE.

20:30 23:00 2.50 Remove and set out rotary table, remove annular BOP. Cut off & replace adapter union set
with welder. Install & nipple up annular BOP. Install rotary table.

23:00 23:30 0.50 Trip in 4 stands DCs to 378'.

23:30 00:00 0.50 Test BOPE to 577 psi, hold for 10 min, OK.

00:00 01:00 1.00 Trip in to 1288'".

01:00 02:00 1.00 Drill out cement, float collar, cement & shoe at 1334".

19



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

DAILY OPERATIONS

Day Report Depth FtCut Start End Hrs Reported Activity (previous 24 hr leading to 6 AM report time)
Date

02:00 06:00 4.00 Drill 7 7/8" hole 1334' - 1453'.

8 9-Jun 2470 1017 06:00 15:00 9.00 Drill 1453 - 1869'.
15:00 1530 0.50 Service rig. Work on 2" line to BOP.
15:30 19:30  4.00 Drill 1869 - 2026'.
19:30 20:00 0.50 Circulate. Survey 2026'--1 deg.
20:00 06:00 10.00 Drill 2026' - 2470'.

9 10-Jun 3079 609 06:00 07:30 1.50 Drill 2470' - 2557".
07:30 08:00 0.50 Displace hole with mud.
08:00 15:.00 7.00 Drill 2557 - 2866'".
15:00 15:30 0.50 Service rig.
15:30 19:30 4.00 Drill 2866' - 3021".
19:30 20:30 1.00 Circulate. Survey 3021'--1.25 deg.
20:30 23:00 250 Drill 3021' - 3079
23:00 23:45 0.75 Circulate samples.
23:45 01:45 2.00 Wipe hole to shoe at 1334". Trip in to 3079
01:45 03:.00 1.25 Circulate bottoms up twice.
03:00 06:00 3.00 Trip out for DST 1. Strap drill pipe out.

10 11-Jun 3247 168 06:00 06:30 0.50 Pick up & make up DST tools.
06:30 08:00 1.50 Trip in with DST 1. Test LKC zones D, E, & F 3032' - 3079".
08:00 12:15 4.25 DST 1: Open 15 min, shut-in 60 min, open 60 min, shut-in 120 min.
12:15  13:30  1.25 Trip out with DST 1. Gas at 10 stands out, estimate 2396', no H2S.
13:30 14:30 1.00 Recovered 110 ft of mud cut oil. Break down & lay down DST tools.
14:30 15:45 1.25 Make up bit 2 & BHA.Trip in to 1334'.
15:45 16:.00 0.25 Fill drill pipe and circulate out gas from same.
16:00 17:00 1.00 Trip in to 3079
17:00 18:00 1.00 Circulate out gas from drill pipe & hole (1298 units).
18:00 01:00 7.00 Drill 3079' - 3239,
01:00 06:00 5.00 Drill 3239' - 3247'. Drill 1 ft at a time, then circulate samples for top of Arbuckle.

20



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

DAILY OPERATIONS

Day Report Depth FtCut Start End Hrs Reported Activity (previous 24 hr leading to 6 AM report time)

Date

11 12-Jun 3256 9 06:00 12:30 6.50 Drill 3247' - 3256'".
12:30 14:.00 1.50 Wipe hole to shoe at 1334". Trip in to 3256'".
14:00 1500 1.00 Circulate 2x bottoms up.
15:00 17:00 2.00 Trip out for DST 2.
17:.00 18:15 1.25 Make up DST 2 & trip in to 3256.5'".
18:15 22:45 450 DST 2: Open 15 min; shut-in 60 min; open 60 min; shut-in 120 min.
22:45 05:45 7.00 Unseat DST packer. Rig down DST head & hose. Wait for daylight to pull DST 2. Gained

500 Ibs--6000 Ibs on weight indicator.

05:45 06:00 0.25 Trip out with DST 2.

12 13-Jun 3365 109 06:00 06:45 0.75 Trip out with DST 2. Oil skim water 806'".
06:45 07:30 0.75 Reverse out skim oil to water truck.
07:30 08:30 1.00 Trip out with DST 2. Lay down and load out DST 2 tools.
08:30 09:15 0.75 Make up bit 2 & trip in to shoe at 1334".
09:15 09:30 0.25 Fill pipe at shoe.
09:30 10:15 0.75 Trip in to 3256'".
10:15 11:15 1.00 Circulate 2x bottoms up.
11:15 1545 450 Drill 3256' - 3365'.
15:45 16:15 0.50 Circulate bottoms up.
16:15 17:30 1.25 Wipe hole 18 stands to 2230'". Trip in to 3365'".
17:30 18:30 1.00 Circulate 2x bottoms up.
18:30 21:00 2.50 Drop survey tool. Trip out for wireline logs.
21:00 01:00 4.00 Safety meeting w/ rig crew & Pioneer loggers. Rig up & run DIL-GR-SP CNL-CDL-GR-Cal-

MLL & Sonic logs.

01:00 03:30 2.50 Make up bit 2 & trip in to shoe at 1334". Fill pipe. Trip in to 3365'".
03:30 05:30 2.00 Circulate hole clean for casing. Wait for casing crew to help lay down drill pipe.
05:30 06:00 0.50 Lay down drill pipe to run 5 1/2" production casing.

13  14-Jun 3365 0 06:00 10:00 4.00 Lay down drill pipe, drill collars, kelly, rat hole & mouse hole.

10:00 14:00 4.00 Safety meeting with rig crew & casing crew. Rig up casing tools. Run 81 jts 3385.70' of J-55
15.5#5 1/2" LT&C 8rd casing. Shoe set at 3364'.

21



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

Day Report
Date

Depth  Ft Cut

Start

14:00

15:30

16:30

17:00

18:00

21:00
02:00

End

15:30

16:30

17:00

18:00

21:00

02:00
06:00

Hrs

1.50

1.00

0.50

1.00

3.00

5.00
4.00

DAILY OPERATIONS

Reported Activity (previous 24 hr leading to 6 AM report time)

Circulate hole with 5 1/2" casing clean. Reciprocate 15 ' while circulating. Saftey meeting
with rig crew & cementers.

Break last joint 5 1/2" casing. Rig down casing tools. Rig up cement head & lines. Make up
last joint 5 1/2" casing.

Cement rat hole & mouse hole.

Cement 5 1/2" casing. Cement 5.5" casing. Pump 5bbls fresh water followed by 10bbls DU
1100 mud flush, followed by 5bbls fresh water. Pump 30sx neat rathole 20sx neat mouse
hole. Mix & pump 330ft3/tf or 58.77bbls or 210sx ASC 10% salt + 6% gypseal + 5#/sx
coalseal +0.03%FL160 + 1.4% defoamer. Shut down, flush lines clean, release wiper plug.
Displace with 80bbls fresh water. Bump plug with 1050 psi with 350 psi prior. Hold 1050 psi
for 5 minutes (ok) release pressure floats held (ok). CIP @ 17:45hrs 6/13/2014. Rig down

cementers. Good circulation throuah cement job.
Pick up BOP. Set casing slips with 60K. Rough cut 5 1/2" casing, lay down 18" of cut-off 5

5 1/2" casing. Nipple down BOP. Weld slip on 5 1/2" casing collar 6" above ground level.
Install rubber packing, split rings & wing union on Larkin style wellhead. Install 5 1/2" x 2"
swedge, 2" ball valve, and secure well.

Clean and shovel out mud tanks. RELEASE RIG 02:00 HRS 6/14/2014

Wait on daylight to rig down rig for rig move.
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Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel 'A' 27

MUD RECORD
Report # Date Depth WT Vis PV YP Gels  Filtrate APl Cake pH  Alkilinity H,O % Chlorides Solids Sand Calcium LCM Remarks

ft Ib/gal  sec/qt cp Ib/100ft* 10s/10m x/32" ppm ppm % ppm  Ib/bbl
1 6/3 0 9.6 40 water 7.0 390 140
2 6/5 799 10.2 41 n/c 7.0 86.9 7,800 13.1 trace hvy trace
3 6/6 1334 10.3 42 n/c 7.0 91.2 91,000 8.8 trace hvy trace
4 6/8 1806 9.3 29 n/c 7.0 93.2 6,400 6.8 trace hvy 0
5 6/9 2826 9 44 12 11 7/28 8.40 1 10.0 048/~ 95.1 1600 4.9 trace 20 0
6 6/10 3079 9.3 67 15 13 8/34 8.80 1 9.5 0.36/- 93 3,200 7 trace 20 0
7 6/11 3256 9.3 52 17 13 8/35 8.80 1 105  0.58/- 93 3,000 7 trace 10  trace
8 6/12 3256 9.2 57 19 21 10/25 8.80 1 11.0 0.72/- 93.7 2,000 6.3 trace 20 trace

23



Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel 'A' 27

MUD RECORD
Report # Date Depth WT Vis PV YP Gels  Filtrate APl Cake pH  Alkilinity H,O % Chlorides Solids Sand Calcium LCM Remarks
ft Ib/gal  sec/qt cp Ib/100ft* 10s/10m x/32" ppm ppm % ppm  Ib/bbl

ABBREVIATIONS & UNITS

Weight (Wt) Ibs/gal
Viscosity (Vis) sec/qt
Plastic Viscosity (PV) centipoise
Yield Point (YP) 1bs/100 sq ft
Gel Strengths (Gels) 1bs/100 sq ft (10 sec / 10 min)
Filtrate API ml/30 min
Filter cake x/32"
Alkinlinity ppm

H,0 % % water by volume
Chlorides ppm in water phase
Solids % by volume
Sand % by volume
Calcium ppm in water phase
Lost circulation material (LCM) Ib/bbl added

24



Berenergy Corporation

H. J. Roetzel ‘A’ 27

BIT RECORD
Bit | Size | Make | Serial No. Type Depth Ft Hrs Ft/Hr WOB RPM Pump Nozzle | Condition Reason
Out Cut K Press Size TBG Pulled
1| 1214 Jz GAl15 J21214 Tricone 1334 1334 285| 46.8 3x15, 1x13  4-4-1/8 Surface Casing
2| 77/8 z 1403160 HAZDQ Tricone 3365| 2031 65.0/ 31.2| 26-35 65-85 |800-1000(2x14, 1x13| 3-3-1/16 TD

25




Berenergy Corporation
H. J. Roetzel 'A' 27

DEVIATIONS
MD INC

ft deg

0 0
315 0.25
620 0.75
902 0.25
1334 0.75
2026 1.00
3021 1.25
3365 0.5

26



Berenergy Corporation
Roetzel 'A' 27

DRILLING CURVE
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	Confidential: No
	olicense: 4967
	oname: Berenergy Corporation
	oaddr1: 7114 W. Jefferson Ave.
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	oarea: 303
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