STATE 'OF KANSAS

TATE CORPORATION COMMISSION

Sive Vail Information Completely

May Required Affidavit

K

WELL PLUGGING RECORD

Make Required Attidavit Mail or Deliver Report to:		W.	ELL PLU	GGIN	G RE	CORD		
Conservation Division State Corporation Commission 212 North Market, Insurance Bldg.	D -	. 1		_		00		_
Wichita, Kansas		oks	Count	y. Sec.∠	Tv	vp.9S Rge.	(E)	<u> </u>
NORTH	Location as "NE Lease Owner	CNWXSWX"	or footage fro	m lines_	SW/4	NE/4 SW/	4	
	Lease Owner Lease Name	M. L.		шрану		***	Well No	2
	Office Address		50, Tul	sa. C	klah	oma	WEII NO.	<u> </u>
	Character of W		-	-		Oil		
	Date well comp					ovember 2	6.	19 54
23	Application for	plugging filed_			F	ebruary l	3,	19.62
and the state of t	Application for p							19
	Plugging comme					ebruary 8		19_62
2						ebruary l	0,	19 62
	Reason for aban	donment of we	ll or producing	g tormat	ion	пертегео		
	If a producing	well is abandon	ed date of la	et produ	ction .	October	17	10 67
						its agents before		
Locate well correctly on above Section Plat	menced?	Yes	-				P-066-06 11	
Name of Conservation Agent who super	ervised plugging of this	well Mr.	Eldon	Petty	-			
Producing formation Arbuckle			730 Botton	n		Total Depth of W	7ell 374	Fee
Show depth and thickness of all water	, oil and gas formation	S.						
OIL, GAS OR WATER RECORD	OS					C.A	SING REC	ORD
FORMATION	CONTENT	FROM	70					
Arbuckle Lime	Oil		2777 •	S12		PUT IN	PULLED OF	JT
AI DUCKLE IIIIIE	UII.	3731	37411		211	376016"	None 2834	
)-1/	~	3700.0	2074.	
	- 450 Million		-					
Describe in detail the manner in	1		<u> </u>	<u> </u>	L			
in introducing it into the hole. If cen feet for each plug so Sand		,			~	-		
5 sacks o	f cement		3701 ¹ 3180 ¹		3180	` 		
Mud	<u> </u>		31401		<u>31401</u> 5501			,
	common cemen	ıt	5501		4901			
10 sacks	<u> Halco Gel</u>		4901		180			
20 sacks	common cemen	it	1801		1201			
Mud			120		401			
Rock		1.	401		301			
Surface s	common cemen	<u> </u>	301 61		61			
Dailace 3	VLL		0.	LO	Surf.			
				•			710	
					· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
						MAD -	W/W/3/53	<u> </u>
•			,		Ge	WSERVAL9	1962	101
		77-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7			-	SERVALT.	62	-
						Wiching W	Diffic.	
		- Contraction of the Contraction					S SON	
	(If additional o	description is neces	ssarv. use BACK	of this she	at \	***************************************	7	
	<u>ce Pipe Serv</u>	<u>ice</u>						
Address P	.O. Box 304,	<u>Great</u> E	Bend, Ka	nsas				
	-							
state of Kansas	COID	NTY OF	Reno					
	ith					SS.		_
well, being first duly sworn on oath,		wledge of the	facts stateme	wner) o	r. (OWRE	MKOPERATORX of	the above-de	escribed
above-described well as filed and that	the same are true and	correct. So h	elp me God	aud	matters	morem contained	and the log	or the
			(D)	ž .5.) <u> </u>			
	(Signature)						
			Box 391	, Hut			sas	
Subscribed and Sworn to before	re me this 16th	day of_	Ma	rch	(Ac	ldress) 19 62	2	
2		uay OI_				, 19	-	
A 4	7 70/0	Name of the last o	July	chri	W X	y grhi	une!	
My commission expires April '	/ , 1903		(/ "			* //	Notary Pu	ıblic.

Chapter 1 to make to

Form N47A R	ev.				,	15-	163	-03	32/9	-0	0-0	TO									-
	N	IORTH	ТТ	1 (1		•	N		- 1	٧.			ier G	TT	(\sim	7.1	D A	N		
Work com'd Rig Contracto Drilling Con	ortractor	r.,,,,,,			140-	Lease Loca mp'd		e and ription adef	No.	om I S	North Dr.	line line	19 mid	ell R	ecor	Well N	ast lir	ne of		Elev.	
Rotary Drillin		•	12 .		1. ·	to)4 [4			ol Drill shot or					oil	to		
Dry Gas Wel Casing Head Braden Head Braden Head	Il Pres	s Pressi	ıre			Gas I	Pressur Pressur	6		* 1	yay.		Volum Volum Volum Volum	e							
DDOD! ICINIC	TEO		TTO L		-11		,	7 10	4		1 × ×	- 125.7 T		9 4%	vector in the		rete j uluju.		,		
PRODUCINO	J FOI	(MA	HON.		(Na	ime)					-	-	The state of the s	om 🧦	744		тот	AL C	EPTI	I _2/	
e			Wher	· .	PULL	ED OL	ГТ		CASI		REC	ORL).						re èvels dus		
Size	Wt.	Thds.	Set	Jts	`	Feet	In.	Ĵts.	Fee		In.	36.0	KIND	Cot	nd'n	Sacks U	Jsed	CE	MENT Meth	ING od Emple	oyed
									2	1.6 60	8		1.3 1 5 2 2	##	5	1.7 1.5					
- (8 · 5/2		4.9	ing.	oet.	*	10	cel		6.134	Œ.	58.1	CQ.	s&d	iod		101		oor		and mention with	
		-					ě			+	,	***************************************					- 1				
		_								1											
						, w.	1. 2.1		• • •			(Tik +)	er e	+ -		STAT				·	3 t 4
	Li	ner	Set at				Lengtl	1			Per	orate	d at				11/1/	URAJ	104 A		
Packer Set at						*	_	1	*		_Peri	orate	d at	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , 		Mara	MA	RI	9 76,		V.,
Packer Set at_				5	-	and K									عامورات		COLY	77ON	~	¥	3 4/6
<u> </u>	,				1.	S	НОТ	ÓR	ACID	TR	EAT	MEN'	T REC	ORD					100	YON	
Date			***	FIRST		hades to a	1	1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 -	SECO	ND				TI	IIRD	,,			r a., F	OURTH	
)) 7 a		 300	<u>. / 25</u>	<u>/ 34</u>	Gal		-545	7	-, '	- (Sals.			, ,	C	Gals.	1 A 4 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1			Y
Shot Between	. 13	77	F	-	37	Ų. ĮF	t.		Ft. and	l .		Qts. Ft.		Ft. ar	nd .		Qts. Ft.		Ft.	and	
Size of Shell Put in by (Co.))		M . * *		(urfamily MAN)	115		F. Mar.		7.						1 43	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,				tali Toka
Length anchor	* 3	1.21			Alega Nasa	103	7 7 2 74 74 74	- 14	12.	,	100	1. P. 1.		4			4		1 ·· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		derit.
Distance below Damage to Cas					The say				, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , 	2.	1 1	A				1949 1411 - 151	1.	3 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	104	V V V	
r Casing Shou	lder	J	-						'I		<u> </u>		,								
, T.,	· ;	3. 5 T)		Park take That the) . 3	SIGN.	IFICA	and the same and	GEOL S	OG			RMAT	IONS	, i	about 1 and		,			
NA			1	Тор	Во	ottom	Fron		То		From	OII	* То					REMAR	KS	9 19 5	
TOP TOP		- 46		1266		£ .	· (, ·)	. t	14 m		100	No. 44	 							kili.	
ine mer Toronto			98										11 2 2 13			1	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	The state of the s		3 / 18 (CH	
	1.11			.13	*	ì			A CONTRACTOR						· · ·				1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1		Addition to
Conglos	411	6		617	*				in the second		36	56	367				11		}		
			1 1		*			1 1			77	70 1	27			Loc	60			n t	Para Military Control
			J						Markey .					**************************************	- ,100(1)(1)(1)	and the second	PART THAT			THE BEACH	44.4 ·
	· I.	DA	TE CO.	MENCE	- व				IING			· 'Y'		is and the same of			- 1 1 1			No.	***************************************
st		المرد	L COM	vieinc <u>é</u>	<u>.</u>	DAT	E COM		D"	P	ROD.	BEFOR	E	PRO	DD. A	FTER	- 1	C D	-	MARKS	
nd		- ','		<u> </u>	1 . 3		To be		* .	g ·	\$ 100 miles		1		34,54	11.1				for oth	er det
rd	2					4	* <u>#1.</u>		GW.		***	**		7. 191	1 2 3	T	1 112			1 2 8	

(See Reverse for Record of Formation)

No. Feet Plugged Back or Deepened

PLUGGING BACK AND DEEPENING RECORDS

Prod. Before

Prod. After

22

REMARKS

See Reverse for other detail

22

22 🛴 🧎 25

,,

"

.,,

4th

1st

2nd

3rd 4th Date Commenced

Date Completed

RECORD OF FORMATIONS

воттом

FORMATION	TOP TOP	воттом	Indicate Casing Points, Describe Shows of Oil, Gas and Water, etc.
and, rock and shale		125	THE HOLD PROPERTY OF THE PARTY
hale and sholls	12	224	et and comented 6-5/8"50, 244.
samed 9" hole to 12-1/4"			T. A. A. A. A. C. CARLOS (F CONT.)
the statement of the st		paper .	cease, 3% Gel, and 2% calcium
	· gang	Spring" 6. Bonories (aus	chloride. Cesent circulated.
tale and shalls	324		The leading of the second of t
ond, shale and shalle			
bele, shells and red bed shrorite	1600		
sale, shells and red bed			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
agle and salt	1.550	1945	a market in the first term of the control of the co
hale and mells	1945	2072	omen hande state of the state o
hale and line			
nata	-0171		The second secon
記録 (英宗) (東京) 「東京 「東京 東京 「東京 大学 「東京 大学 「東京 大学 」 「「東京 大学 」 「「「東京 」 「「「東京 」 「「「東京 」 「「「東京 」 「「「「東京 」 」 「「「「「「「「「「			
***	o 10 Primaria VIII	2.15	
ream, dense lime	3492	3498	- Spotted stain, trace of oil,
ime and shale			Tair portelly
an, dense lime			Then stale, fair vacular
ustandi shi 💆 ushir ushir di ka salah dah	The Street Street	TANTA	
		3509	
	3303		Took stain and ports by
\$ 570 Med			Can Halliburton drill stem
TO PART OF THE STATE OF THE STA	×	All the second	22 ancher, open 1 hour, strong
			blow. recovered 2400 selt water.
	jan van i e s ni s	A CONTRACTOR	no oil, hir-1200; initial flow.
Market and the sense of the same Mark and Market and	物證整機	" · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Tinel Clow 1170.
ime and shale hite, dense lime	3513 3543		Very poor perceity, trace of
man-from and also december after the control of the			
ine and shale	3533 -		
hito, dense lime	3562	30 m M 30	
inte, chalky line			foor porosity, poor spotted
	han a sami may kama	Laborate in State State 1	A STATE OF THE STA
	3.50	3611	I have the treat with the first of the second
hite, chalky like	1011	3615	foor perestry, poor spected
	2512	24.00	
hite, chalky lime		1606	Poor porosity, poor spotted as the
The state of the s	The second secon	The second of th	
hele and lime ari-eolored chert	3525		107 (20010) (8847) 3647
ari-ediored chert	3635		The oil and old in samples
			SETURATION, BORY dark free oil
hale and line			101 014 000 1600
KANKA, SI DAKASA A KANDO	And the same of th	Airl	
		and appelled lifes	20 a. 46 Mg
ine to sedim grained	3706	3710	Dark dead oil staining, fair
ine to medium grained	() () () () () () () () () ()		
ine to medium grained sand	3710		
ine to medium grained sand ime to medium crystalline			
ine to medium grained sand			

Set and communed \$1 \text{\finite}, 12.5\text{\finite}, data, 2-2, 4-55, data is casing a cond. Let 3731 with 150 seeks of coment and \$5 \text{\finite} finished \text{\finite} 000 p.s 1/12/54. Opened stage coller at \$155 \text{\finite} 900 \text{\finite} circulated 1 heir. Potted 155 harrels of heavy oil health \$5 seeing, oil circulated, closed tage coller with 1600 \text{\finite} finished 11/17/56 at 8:00 p.s. Trinished of OO p.m.

Fored in cable tools on hovember 17, swabbed and balled hole dry to 165*, 52* casing tested dry. Drilled commut plug and cleaned out to ottom, 1732', no steel link correction, coment tested of. Jespened as

Tay, medium crystalline delight perceity and state and all, no fill

Person the anthro

A 1150 - 121 - 121 - 122 - 121 - 122 emented which of macks of common sevent and 2% calcing chiloride followed ith 65 sacks of common propert. Extended 185 sector of cement below stainer, reversed out estimated 20 make al commit. Julied 2" tubing ad shut down for demants to each

The brought he brown set with the control

at JINO, Miral cesting tested dry. Drilled out retainer at JINO and coment to 1000, Miral cesting tested dry. Drilled out retainer at JINO and to bottom and drilled up bridging plug at JYNO.

crystalline dolomito	3733	3733	foor porosity and saturation
Cray and brown medium trystalline dolomics with	3735	3737	and the state of t
trace of green shale	3737	3739	Four purceity, elight seture tion, elight show of all
crystalline delomite, slight increase in green		,	
	3739	2744	Good purcelly and saturation Bailed and Lerted 50 gallons of oll per hour, no water

707 AL BOPTA 3741*

Prosted through 51" casing with 300 gallons of Halliburton 15% acid

The second 10:24 pa 300 gallome of sold in, start oil 10:44 pm 11:00 pm actd on bottom A WO. 30 gallons of seld in fermation 11:15 pm Vac. log college of acid in formation 220 fellons of acid in formation A WG. Vac. 300 gallone of acid in formation flushed with d berrels of oil

Tracting, them swedded 3 hours, 42 berrels of all with trace of acid water. Has 2" tubing and rode and an November 24, 700 6 hours, 72 berrel

of oil and il barrels of water to establish % hour State Corporation consistion potential of 36 barrels. Allowable 25 barrels per day.

THE FRENCH SERVICE AND AND AND ADDRESS.

	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
	AND THE CONTRACTOR OF THE CONT	
,	TAMA	3/4
,	5000	
	2500*	
	3000	3/4 " STATE POSPORATION COMMISSIO!
		and

MAR 19 1962

CONSERVATION DIVISION Wichita, Kansas

M. L. CASEI MELL NO. 2 (Rocks Co., Mant.)

PLANATED BACK RECORD

Date Completed: Sevenber 4, 1988

Flugged back from 3761 to 3755

Production Defere: A berrole of all and 3% barrols of mage: Production After: 100 M. hours, Af barrols of all and 300 barrols water

Freducing from open hele

iroducing formstion: Arbuckle Line

On Cotober 1 and Cotober 2 and

PLACED BACK TOTAL DEPTH 3735.

Anaped lower of sallbares of sa

SINTE CONTRACT 1962

MAR 19 1962

CONSERVATION DIVISION Wichits, Kenny

FORM 16+136 (REV. 9/60)

SKELLY OIL COMPANY

CHANGE IN WELL RECORD

Give complete description of all cleaning out, deepening, plugging back and fishing jobs, changes in casing, material lost in hole, etc, not recorded in original well record.

SECBLOCK							- -		cou	LL NO NTY TE		DIS	TRICT_		AFE	·	
Date comme Deepened fro Plugged bac	m k from		773			to _			Date	comp	leted	Total	Depth _				19
Cleaned out Production b Production of Tools owned Cost of Job	efore ter by;			7.02.0	_ bbls. o	to _ pil _ pil _	Revise	ed Estima	_ Kind ted Pa	used;	_ bbls. w _ bbls. w 	vater		No. c	ays rig	j time;	cu. ft.
DATE		TYI	PE TREA	TMENT		INT	TF RVAL	REATM TREATE	ENT	REG		INT OF	TREAT	MENT			
		teritoria de la constanta de l La constanta de la constanta de											Sin.	Series Control of the			SION
	AND THE REAL PROPERTY.		WH	ERE SE		CHA	NGE	ES IN	CASI	NG	RECOR	D	-00	MAR MSERVAT	THE SECTION	1918 1809 La	5.A.
STRINGS Production	SI	ZE		(Depth)	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •			Top Cemit.		as'g.			R	emarks:	. Kan	DIVIDIC SPF	
Liner										То	p liner;						
SIZE	WT.	THDS		KIND		100	Jts.	Fact	TM	30	Feet WTM	7/3/1	- Jts.				
PRODUCIN	it de	FORMAT	ION		1			N HOLE ORATIONS		то		ВО	ттом	Total N	o. Sho	ts	

R

On October 18, 1961, moved in and rigged up cable tools, pulled rods and 25" tubing. Set 55" Baker bridging plug at 3725".

THE CHAIN JOB NO. 1 - Conglomerate - 3/2/* 1000:

3656*-3673* - 6* - 24 jen holes - No shows 3656*-3666* - 10* - 46 jen holes - No shows

Plugged back with 1 sack of Cal-Seal from 3715* to 3701*. tubing and sot 5%" padter at 3642".

10/19/01 treated of Malifornia with 500 mallons of 15% acid, used 50 marrels water, mardons 12-750%, time 50 minutes, pressure dropped to

Swebbed through 2 taking 5 hours, so all and 56 berrels water used in treatment. Packer leaking. Fulled tubing and sacker. Swebbed through 52" casing 2 hours, so all or gas above and 3. burrels water used in treatment; bailed , hours, is sallows formation all and 4. borrolo acid water.

Ren 2" twing with 52" Relliburton 2725 packer, set packer at 3623".

1717: treated of Hall Turton Mains of Carrols water to fill employ. restared to 350°, pumped IS barrels oil through 2° units; at barrels per minute at 2400°, pixed 65 barrels baroseme with 2000° of 20/40 fractions and 500° of fu-2-Del, 210 pallons of 7-10 and 20° of countic, resoured 2300°, flushed with 50 barrels crude oil, maximum 19-2750°, broke to 2200°, finished at 750°, time 1° minutes.

heleased 4500-77 with approximately 10 barrels back flow. Polled tubing and packer. Swabbed, bailed, and cleaned out bale to 3640*. Swabbed through 50" saaing 15 hours, 46 barrels of all used in treatment and 60 barrels of water.

15-105-1324-12-13

· Por

The control of the co

1192*-3200* - 2* - 32 jet holes 3577*-3500* - 11* - 44 jet holes - No fluid change

Nam 2" tubing and set 5%" Balliburton Di straddle packers with bottom packer at 3595° and top packer at 3556°.

10/23/01 created by Hallburton through 2° tubing with 500 mallons of 15 penetrating with 500 mallons of 15 penetrating with 50 maleum 10-1000, broke to 300%, finished at 0%, flushed with 15 barrels of water, time 7 minutes.

Swabbed through tabing 1 hour, no oil and 15 barrels of water used in treatment. Swabbed through tabing 12 hours, no oil and 46 barrels of formation water.

Raised tubing and reset 52° MM straddle packers with bottom packer set at 3217° and top packer at 3276° .

TO ATTEMPT TO . (- Acid - 3)22-200 10/24/01 treated through 2" turing by halliburton with 500 gallons of 15 penetrating NE acid, maximum 17-800), broke to 100/, finished on Year, flushed with 15 harrols of water, time 30 minutes.

Swebbed through 2" tubing 1 hour, no cil and 15 barrols of water used in treatment. Swebbed through tubing 10 hours, no cil and 57 barrols of formation water. Pulled tubing and packers and noved out cable tools.

Shut down for orders.

PLUCCED RACE TOTAL DEPTH

3777

SKELLY OIL COMPANY

CHANGE IN WELL RECORD

Give complete description of all cleaning out, deepening, plugging back and fishing jobs, changes in casing, material lost in hole, etc. not recorded in original well record.

LEASE NA	ME	la la	4.436	STANK!				NO						
SEC.	_		RR		-			(<u> </u>			· /	AFE	NO.	-
.DLOOK			ORVET.			S	HAIE.		SIE/OSD					
		7	YPE OF W	OPK			12 (2) A.J	7 1 2 3 pr 14 2 1						
		•	TPE OF W	UKK			All Districts							
Date comme				27 8,	i.	19 <u>^</u> D	ate co	mplefed						19
Deepened fro	om	45.00	W	to .	Mr.		- William P		. Total	Depth _		45		
				to					. P.B.T.	D		- ,		
Production b	rrom pefore		in.	hbis oil				hhle w	- iatar					
Production a	fter		e .1895	bbis. oil				bbis. w	rater				cu	. TT
Tools owned	by;		<u>je jervice</u>			K	ind us	ed;	1 200	2012 C	No. 0	davs rid	a time	h
Cost of Job	\$				Revise	d Estimated	Payou	t (Mos.)		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	w-			
				-	TF	REATMEN	IT R	ECORD				-		-
DATE		TYP	E TREATMENT	INT		TREATED			NT OF	TREAT	MENT	1,		,
				ļ										
						· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·					-			
														
·				СН	ANGE	S IN CA	SING	PECOB	_			-		
STRINGS	SIZ	-	WHERE SET			TING RECOF		RECOR					-	
	312		(Depth)	Sac	ks Used	Top Cemit. Bh	d. Cas'g.	·		F	REMARKS			,
Production Liner								Ton Hann				- 		
		L				1		Top liner;					-	
SIZE	WT.	THDS.	KIND	CONE		Ĺ	EFŢ	IN		1	PU	LLED	OUT	
5-1/2	1547	1,,00.		CON	Jts.	East C	I Ja	Fret	in.	Jts.	Eset.	A In.		<u> </u>
		Medition:		i i	JI.)	343			47.2		22.2		26,34	1
					 		 							+
,														+
000011011	==	~~	,						•					
PRODUCIN	NG FR	QM												
	T-07-14-14-14-14-14-14-14-14-14-14-14-14-14-			thru	OPE	N HOLE					Total N	No Shr	nte	
		FORMATI						TOP	ВО	TTOM	10.01	10. 3110	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	
REMARKS (G	ive revie	w of w	ork performed and	any othe	r comm	nent of inter	est)							
An Th	rathe Manualli	all the second second	in Themas	an attans	All conserved	The second second	in Marine	Marian Marian	one office one or	u destri stillik			has, many	
12001		2006		14-41	lo.	and an			4					
al apo	CHILL C		rchaety re	corex	7 14									
to pl	ALC: OF	ud <i>m</i> i			40	760		The same of the sa	4 4	y and the same of		AMBON LAND	Lincial ages . Hillion addition.	
2/8/6	2 13434	red i		ed a	1.1				ed v2	77.22		12.01		
	ilotri		,		7.00	AND THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPER			into.	salden antibile.		- and and different	90°3311	
								· ten	et aleest	P.				
			sacits of c	umant,	,	,	310		140	•				
Shot	off j	la c		011°.			(34)		a co					
							40.00	W-1981	and the same of	9	•			
				e en e	July and		3.4.	and the second of the second o		<i>,</i>				
		10		eo Ce	The second second	age sign			100	•				
			andis on				100)* (a)	1.00	į.				
			a ada				1.3	Sic tables	40*).				
		ages of		tric m		Y No.				r				
				manye 1979 Bill	Printed in the last	dis App.		•						

Plussed and chandoned Vebrusev 10, 1962.

