Form CP-4

STATE, OF KANSAS
STATE CORPORATION COMMISSION
Give All Information Completely
Make Required Affidavit
Mail or Deliver Report to:
Conservation Division

WELL PLUGGING RECORD

State Corporation Commission 212 No. Market	Kingmar	1	Count	v sec30 r	rum 27S Rose	(E) 10 (W)
Wichita, Kansas NORTH	Location as "NE		or footage fro	m lines C	SW/4	(1)
	Lease Owner	Skelly	Oil Compa	.ny		
	Lease Name		ham "B" U			. Well No39
	Office Address				er, Colorad	
					Gas-Oil-SWR	W
	Date well comp				April 28.	
30	Application for	plugging filed_	^		April 11, & October	19 67 31. 19 67
	Application for p				October 31	
	Plugging comple				November 9.	
\chi	Reason for aban		ll or producing		No longer n	
	injection					
	If a producing	well is abandon	ed, date of la	st production_		19
	Was permission	obtained from				re plugging was com-
Locate well correctly on above Section Plat	menced? Yes		4 T) 3 ·			
Name of Conservation Agent who sup	ervised plugging of this	s well Mr	• A• EIVI	.ng		1100 -
Producing formation			Botton	n		Well <u>4198</u> Feet BTD 3519 •
Show depth and thickness of all wate	r, oil and gas formation	s.			1.	010))19
OIL, GAS OR WATER RECOR	DS				(CASING RECORD
FORMATION	CONTENT	FROM	то	SIZEOD	PUT IN	PULLED DUT
Viola Lime	Gas	4017	4023	1311	3281 711	None
Lansing Lime	Oil	34901	3510	8-5/8"	4044 911	9921 911
					15.00	
					JAN	2 1968
						100
				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Rock	1-2-68
<u>Crushed</u> Sand	rock			to 3475 to 3450 to		
Sand 15 sacks	agment					
Mud lade			3405	to 300°		
Rock bri			3001	to 2901		Ŋ
25 sacks			290°			
Mud lade			2681			
Rock bri					£17	
20_sacks Surface				to Base o r to Surfa		
Duriace	2011		OGTIGI	t oo barra	00	
	-					
					· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
		·				
						
	(If additional	description is nece	essary, use BACK	of this sheet)		<u>-</u>
	lph Comstock P		g, Inc.			
Address 320 No. Park, Sta	fford, Kansas	67578				
STATE OF Colorado	, COU	NTY OF	Denver		_, ss.	
Leland Franz			employee of	owner) or (🏧	•	of the above-described
well, being first duly sworn on oath,	says: That I have known	owledge of the	facts, stateme	ents, and matte	ers herein contain	ed and the log of the
above-described well as filed and that	at the same are true an	d correct. So	help me God.		7	<u> </u>
, , , , ,		(Signature)	Sela	ud a	nam,	
			.,		Denver, Co	olorado 80203
C	20+2		ъ		(Address)	
Subscribed and Sworn to bef	ore me this 29th	day of_	Dec	cember	, 19	<u>)(</u>
s		_	Me	ہ کے مہاری	1	
My Commission	Texpires June 17 1070		- / /			Notary Public.

______N_136 Rev._1M

SKELLY OIL COMPANY

REPORT OF CHANGE IN WELL RECORD

Give complete description of all cleaning out, deepening, plugging back and fishing jobs, changes in casing, material lost in hole, etc., not recorded in original well record.

	و المراجع المسائلة المراجع المسائلة	MED E	In in	45					e	<u>)9 </u>		Tugha	sti. U	ener Ener	೨	
LEASE								·	WELL	NO.	ו ס	STRICT				
sEC	30	Т.	273	R	113				COUNT	Υ	Hing	M.			<u> </u>	₩. B. NO
SURVEY			BLOC	к					STATE	<u>:</u>	Hoose	*				•
	(LEAN	ING O	JT RI	CORI	D			1	PLUG	GING E	ACK OF	DEE	PENIN	G RECO	ORD
Date comme	enced						1		Date	comme	nced	f.s	460	s Ph	<u>*</u>	19 🔼
Date compl	leted						1	9	Date	compl	eted	<u>િ.</u> દેશ			<u>*</u>	19
Cleaned out	from		to		Т.Т	D	 .		Plugg	ed bac	k oraci	to	393	ુ∌ T	D. 3	9•
Prod. before		bbl oil.	5.	bbls. water.					Prod.	≝© before	*:zazasi: [bls. 🛴	bbls. water.	THE STATE	. 10 jan≇. 10 jan≇. ∰	cu. ft.
Prod. after .		bbl oil.	8.	bbls. water.				cu. ft. gas	Prod.	after .	b 	bls. 5	bbls. water.	[KZP		cu. ft.
Kind of too	ols used	:							Kind	of too	ls used:	Caldo				
Tools owne	d by:								Tools	owned	l by: 🔯	C. C	op.L	aria		
					i (Ti		S	нот	RECO					<i>y</i> - · · ·		
Date			C/		<u>18</u>					,						
Size shot			ļ			Qts.			- <u> </u>	Qts.			Qts.			Qts.
Shot between	en		1450	Ft. an		O _{Ft.}		Ft. a	nd	Ft.	1	Pt. and	Ft.		Pt. and	Pt.
Size of she	11														 .	
Put in by (Co.)		Tai			3)						·				<u> </u>
Length and	hor	<u> </u>														
Distance be	low car	sing	Same	-Ua	, P	rac										
Damage to or casing sh	casing roulder										_			 		
					CF	IANC	GES I	IN CA	SING	RECO	ORD	,				
SIZE	Wt.	Thds.	Where PULLED OUT		7	LEFT	IN In.	KIND		Cond'n	Sacks		MENTING Method Employed			
	 	1	Set	Jts	Feet	In.	Jts.	Feet					Sacks		171011100 2	шрюуса
		+ -				-	 		 			-		1		
		+		 	-		 		 		 -	+	<u> </u>			
	-	+		-		 	+					†	1			
	1	1		l		· - · · ·	<u></u>	1		<u> </u>		'	<u> </u>	!-		
***************************************	L	iner set	at		Le	ngth	•••••	•••••	Per	forated	l at				************	
Packer set a	st		Size	and ki	nd		•					••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••				***************************************
										······			, 	·····		
															Superi	ntendent.

WOOLD DACE TOTAL DEPT	-11 JULY
ANOCLD DACK FOINS DEPT	
	ተቀላ ዓ. ምን ምን ም
െ നടന്നു. പ്രവാന്ത്ര വേദ്യ താര്യത്ത്ര വാര്യത്ത് വാര്യത്ത് വാര്യത്ത് വിവര്യത്ത് വിവര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത്രത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത്രത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത്രത്ത്രത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത്രത്ത്രത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത്രത്ത്രത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത് വര്യത്ത്രത്ത്രത്ത്രത്ത്രത്ത്രത്ത്രത്ത്രത	ens mensor - reprinter
connected to injection	
······································	. Res 2" tubing open ended to 3475" and
	in test chrough 5/0" meter, we'l took 15
	1525 to 3519% Loaded hole with water
***************************************	ng plag at 3525° and plagged back with 2
***************************************	had alipped from 3531' to 3074'. Doe
fulled 24° tubing a	and packer, ran SMM, found Lanc-Wells
	ster pur hour on vacuum.
Nan 10 hour water :	injection test, used 5/8" peter and
	A STATE OF THE STA
injection 144 barr	rels per minuto
ine 36 minutes	
1200 mes 18-33009, c	
Upcd 50 barrels was	•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••
150,000 cale. of w	
() and 10,000 of sa	
***************************************	WIT MO. 1 - Imported 1400' and 3240'
***************************************	rion Sind-Water Tree as follows:
	21" tubing and sot Halliburton ill packer
The state of the s	cable tools, sulled 2° tubing, bathed and through 8-5/8° casing 7 hours, 157
	ම් කරන වන සම්බන්ධ වීම සම්බන්ධ වන සහ සම්බන්ධ වීම සම්බන්ධ සම්බන්ධ වන සම්බන්ධ සම්බන්ධ සම්බන්ධ සම්බන්ධ සම්බන්ධ සම
oved in and ringed up o	ned and any other comment of interest)

(60)

SKELLY OIL COMPANY

JAN 2 1966

CHANGE IN WELL RECORD

Give complete description of all cleaning out, deepening, plugging back and fishing jobs, changes in casing, material lost in hole, etc, not recorded in original well record.

I FASE NAI	ME CARR	ทรง ขาวเครื่องใ	n "B" Unit			S.	MANU HIN FII N	vo. <u>29</u>	‰w∩l c⊤	PICT	Rooky	fnuoit	min 2222	t.
			R. R			cc	UNTY.	Provide Silve	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			AFE	NO	
BLOCK		sui	RVEY		•	S1	ATE_	d.merit in manner						
	4. 4°° -	71	YPE OF W	OPK	PING	AND ARA	DOM					•		
									Fic	- Antiglis	er 9.			67
Date comme	nced		Celober	2 de 18		_ 19 ¹ Do	ite cor	npleted						19
Deepened tro Plugged bac	m k from	3519	18	10 _	Sui	77408			P.B.T.	Deptr D				
Cleaned out	from			to _									· - · - ·	
Production b	efore	hut ac	.b	bis. oil 🕳		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	 -	bbis. wo	iter				cu	ı, ft. gas
Production a	fter	de Cores	itook Pipe P	bls. oil _	UC.	Vi.	ad uso	bbls, we	ter +	3.4.V	No	dave rie	GGU	建矿。gas
Cost of Job	\$		•		Revised	Estimated	Payout	(Mos.)			140.	uuys iig		
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		``			TR	EATMEN	T RI	ECORD			····			
DATE		TYPE	TREATMENT	INT		TREATED			IT OF	TREAT	MENT			
													•	Ç
		·			-	·	-							
							 							
						<u> </u>								
······································				CU	NGE	S IN CA	SING	RECOR	<u> </u>					
OTDINGO	T 01-		WHERE SET			ING RECOR		ILCONE	<u>,</u>		EMARKO		•	
STRINGS	SIZ	E	(Depth)	Saci	s Used	Top Cem't. Bh'c	i. Cas'g.	<u> </u>			EMARKS		4.	,
Production Liner	 							Top liner;						ł.
Linei					I			rop mor,						
SIZE	WT.	THDS.	KIND	COND			EFT I					LLED		
6-5/817	324	6V	19-21 3/3		Jts.	Fact A	lo,	₩TM 3€913	iņ.	dts.	Foot	M (10.	Féet	M din.
U-15/811	32/	87	11-1. 113	D		<u> </u>				1 13	198	15	500	+5-
	<u></u>	1					JAN	2 1150	ļ,		<u> </u>		<u>l</u>	
	או בפ	004					2114	2 1568	·					
PRODUCI	VG FN	OM												
		FORMATIO	N	thru	OPE!	N HOLE ORATIONS -		TOP		TTOM	Total	No. Sh	ots	
								100	вс	TIOM				
REMARKS (ork performed and						u va dada (dele	الديد الأنديد الم	Av. Ob.	a wast	es in	
•	The	well v	me dint dor Teni regila	n 10/1	h/bb orite	when it	een odra	grot on the of h	rs qu Ior it	g aps	nien i	i.	orinity)	
			•										91.07 i . ii.	
	On . Pal	10/31/ Ling,	ei bevon 70 dig ber . oni	end ri ggsd t	aged he s	goll car I an Ille	eina Ollo	, machine wo i	of :		Comov	oek r		
		Gr	ushed book		3	519* to	3475	.*						
		Sa	nd .		2	475° to	3450	; t						
		•	eacks of co		-	450° to								
	Objo (99	t 8-5/ 2.1007	er or earthough of 6-5/69 C	at 10 M cani	196 1 10080	1392*,	120		988*.		Lled 41	jożi	100	
		žtu	44		7 en	4051 to	300) *						
		Co	eghtrei so			300 60	25%)†						
			ents care	4		290 to								
		Mu na	al 101: bridge			268° to								
			ior <i>ortuga</i> I secho demoi			30° to	District	e cellar	j.					
			irinda anii		Ą.	Jallan L	o Su	efaca .						